CASE NO. 11-cv-08607-R-DTB

FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND COSTS TO **MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY** LINN & MAYERS LLP, COUNSEL FOR PERMANENT RECEIVER

Date: July 2, 2012 Time: 10:00 a.m. Ctrm: 8. 2nd Floor

Judge: Hon. Manuel L. Real

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION,

Plaintiff.

٧.

13

14

15

16

17

18

CHARLES P. COPELAND, COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL ADVISORY CORPORATION, AND COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A REAL ESTATE CORPORATION,

Defendants.

19 20

21

22 23

24

25

26 27

28

Mulvaney Barry Beatty Linn & Mayers LLP, formerly known as Mulvaney, Kahan & Barry LLP, (hereafter, "Mulvaney Barry"), general counsel for Thomas C. Hebrank ("Receiver"), the Court-appointed Permanent Receiver for Charles P. Copeland; Copeland Wealth Management, A Financial Advisory Corporation (Copeland Financial); Copeland Wealth Management, A Real Estate Corporation ("Copeland and their subsidiaries and affiliates (collectively, Realty"): "Receivership Entities"), hereby submits its first interim application for approval and payment of fees and reimbursement of expenses.

MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS
ALMIDD UMBUTP PRATRESHE
SENGANTENTH FLOOR
401 WEST A STREET
SAN DEGO, CALLOPSAN ASTOT-394
TELEPHONE 619 228-4010
FACSIMILE 619 228-4051

1.

INTRODUCTION

In the months preceding the Receiver's appointment, the Receivership Entities were very unstable, and unable to satisfy many of their financial and legal obligations. Several creditors had initiated, or were threatening to initiate, legal proceedings. At the request of the Securities and Exchange Commission ("Commission"), the Receiver was appointed as part of the Judgment entered on October 25, 2011. The Judgment authorized the Receiver to employ counsel. On March 12, 2012, the Court authorized the Receiver to employ any of the law firms listed in the Court's report (Dkt. 42); thereafter, the Receiver retained Mulvaney Barry. A number of legal issues required immediate attention, including the following:

(1) Previously, the Receiver sought to retain Allen Matkins Leck Gamble Mallory & Natsis, LLP as counsel. Mulvaney Barry coordinated a timely transfer of the files maintained by that firm, and began a comprehensive review of the files. Notices of substitution were filed in all known cases in which the Receivership Entities had appeared, and Notices of Stay were filed including the Court's March 12, 2012, Order (Dkt. 53), which confirmed the identity of the entities included in the receivership estate.

Copeland Properties 18, LP ("CP 18"), is the owner of a \$9+ million commercial property in North Carolina, and had filed a Chapter 11 bankruptcy in Greensboro, North Carolina in September 2011. CP 18 had defaulted on the mortgage, had filed bankruptcy to prevent foreclosure, and was in the process of attempting to negotiate a sale of the property. CP 18 had moved for bankruptcy court approval of a contemplated sale. The Receiver had gained an understanding of the

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

evaluated the terms and conditions of the bankruptcy case, contemplated sale, and coordinated with local counsel in North Carolina to advise the bankruptcy court and the parties of his appointment. The contemplated sale of the property failed to materialize. Mulvaney Barry conferred with local counsel to ensure that the interests of CP 18 were protected and coordinated efforts to resurrect the sale. At the time of Mulvaney Barry's appointment, there was a pending Motion to Dismiss the CP 18 Bankruptcy proceeding. Mulvaney Barry conferred with the bankruptcy attorney for CP 18 and the attorney for the secured creditor regarding the Receiver's response to the Motion to Dismiss and, based on those discussions, did not oppose the dismissal, which dismissal has now been granted.

- At the time Mulvaney Barry was retained, the Receiver had (2)filed a First Interim Application for approval of fees and costs (Dkt. 40). Several parties had objected, and it was necessary that a Reply be prepared and filed by March 19, 2012. That was accomplished (Dkt. 58). Thereafter, two objecting parties (Flagstar Bank, FSB and certain limited partners of CP-10) filed supplements to their previous objections. While Flagstar essentially withdrew its previous objection (Dkt. 59), the supplement filed by certain limited partners of CP-10 (Dkt. 60) sought to expand the scope of their previous objection. It was necessary for the Receiver to file a reply to the supplements (Dkt. 62). On March 27, 2012, another group comprised of certain other limited partners filed what it termed a "joinder" to the other objections, which raised a number of independent claims and requests (Dkt. 63). A reply to that "joinder" was filed on behalf of the Receiver on March 29, 2012 (Dkt. 64).
- In addition to the bankruptcy proceeding pending in North (3)Carolina, eight of the Receivership Entities were engaged in active

Mulvaney Barry immediately addressed the legal issues described above, each of which is discussed in detail below. Additionally, attorneys Everett G. Barry and John H. Stephens held meetings with Thomas C. Hebrank to coordinate the transfer of his legal representation and to coordinate efforts to protect the rights and properties of the various Receivership Entities. John H. Stephens accompanied the Receiver and appeared before the Court at the April 2, 2012, hearing on the Receiver's First Interim Fee Application. Mulvaney Barry also assisted the Receiver in starting to formulate an overall strategy for maximizing receivership assets, and identifying additional sources of assets potentially available to the receivership estate. Mulvaney Barry also met with the Receiver and Steven M. Hoslett, a CPA and Certified Fraud Examiner, to discuss and develop strategies to maximize the Receiver's recovery of estate assets, including a number of notes receivable in favor of the Receivership's Entities.

Finally, Mulvaney Barry obtained, organized and reviewed files obtained from the Receiver, to ensure coordinated and efficient management of the various litigation cases, and to endeavor to maximize the Receiver's collection of assets belonging to the receivership estate.

For services provided in the case through March 31, 2012, Mulvaney Barry has incurred the amount of \$23,187.00 in fees, and the amount of \$366.33 in expenses. The firm billed a total of 78.6 hours at the Court-Approved hourly rate of \$295. Detailed descriptions of the

2

3

4

5

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

services provided by Mulvaney Barry appear in the invoices attached hereto as Exhibit A. Considering the nature and time constraints attendant to the services provided, the complexity of legal issues addressed, and the results obtained, the requested fees and costs are reasonable.

II.

THE RECEIVER'S EMPLOYMENT OF COUNSEL

The Receiver selected Mulvaney Barry as his general counsel because of (a) the complexity of the case and the legal issues facing the Receivership Entities, (b) the firm's extensive experience and expertise in receivership matters, as well as real estate, financial transactions and litigation matters, and (c) the firm's competitive billing rates among attorneys with similar expertise. As noted above, the Receiver engaged Mulvaney Barry immediately upon authorization by the Court, to address the immediate, complex legal issues facing the Receivership Entities.

III.

FEE APPLICATION

Mulvaney Barry established separate files for the Receivership and for each litigated matter. Insofar as this First Interim Application, time was recorded with respect to the following matters:

21	HEBCO-100	General Copeland Receivership
22	HEBCO-128	Copeland Properties 18, L.P. Bankruptcy
23	HEBCO-130	Tri Tool, Inc. v Copeland, et al.
24	HEBCO-131	Shelton, et al. v. Copeland, et al.
25	HEBCO-132	Ross v. Copeland, et al.
26	HEBCO-133	German American Capital Corp. v. Copeland, et al.
27	HEBCO-137	Telesis Community Credit Union v. Copeland, et al.
28	11111	

1. Activity Categories.

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Within each separate matter file, Mulvaney Barry recorded its time in various categories, assigning a Category Activity Code to each, as follows:

- A. General Receivership
- B. Asset Investigation
- C. Reporting
- D. Operations & Assets Sales
- E. Claims & Distributions
- F. Pending Litigation

With regard to this First Interim Application, work was performed in various activity categories, as follows:

A. General Receivership

This category contains time spent assisting the Receiver in (a) reviewing and analyzing the Commission's Complaint and the Judgment entered by the Court, (b) various discussions with the Commission regarding structure of the Receivership Entities, their assets, and the general status of the receivership proceeding, (c) communications with the Permanent Receiver regarding the scope and effect of the Receiver's appointment and the other provisions of the Judgment, and (d) thorough review of the Court Docket and pleadings and files forwarded by former counsel, as well as files forwarded by the Receiver. Mulvaney Barry caused the Judgment (Dkt. 3) and Order Approving Receiver's Response To Order On Receiver's Application And Report (Dkt. 53) to be filed in all known courts in which the Receivership Entities were Mulvaney Barry also advised the Receiver involved in litigation. regarding issues relating to assets held by various Receivership Entities /////

A summary of time expended by Mulvaney Barry related to Activity Code A follows:

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295.00	12.5	\$3687.50
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295.00	8.	\$236.00
Patrick L. Prindle	Senior Associate	\$295.00	4.7	\$1386.50
TOTAL			18.0	\$5310,00

C. Reporting

This category contains time expended on the Receiver's First Interim Application and responding to objections thereto. The Receiver's First Interim Application for approval and payment of fees and expenses (Dkt. 40) was filed on February 23, 2012. A reply to objections filed by various parties was due March 19, 2012, only one week after the retention of Mulvaney Barry by the Receiver. This category includes all time expended relative to the Receiver's First Interim Application.

A summary of time expended by Mulvaney Barry related to Activity Code C follows:

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	w/kinatak
Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$ 295	2.1	\$619.50
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$ 295	2.9	\$855.50
Patrick L. Prindle	Senior Associate	\$ 295	24.5	\$7227.50
Stacy H. Rubin	Associate	\$ 295	.5	\$147.50
TOTAL			30.0	\$8850.00

F. Pending Litigation

This category contains time assisting the Receiver with pending litigation involving the various Receivership Entities. At the time of Mulvaney Barry's retention as counsel for the Permanent Receiver, ten Receivership Entities were involved in active or threatened litigation. With respect to time expended during the period of this First Interim Application, the following matter files reflect work performed relative to actively litigated matters:

HEBCO-128	Copeland Properties 18, L.P. Bankruptcy
HEBCO-130	Tri Tool, Inc. v Copeland, et al.
HEBCO-131	Shelton, et al. v. Copeland, et al.
HEBCO-132	Ross v. Copeland, et al.
HEBCO-133	German American Capital Corp. v. Copeland, et al.
HEBCO-137	Telesis Community Credit Union v. Copeland, et al.

A summary of time expended by Mulvaney Barry related to Activity Code F follows:

Name	新发生和外外外	Rate	Hours	Fees
Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295	16.4	\$4838.00
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	10.9	\$3215.50
Patrick L. Prindle	Sr. Associate	\$295	3.3	\$973.50
TOTAL			30.6	\$9027.00

2. <u>Matter Summary</u>

The following is a summary of fees billed by each professional with respect to each matter:

1	/	1	/
1	//	7	/
		,	•

|/////

HEBCO-100 - General

Name		Rate	Hours	Fees
Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295	19.2	\$5664.00
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	7.3	\$2153.50
Patrick L. Prindle	Sr. Associate	\$295	31.9	\$9410.50
Stacy H. Rubin	Associate	\$295	.5	147.50
TOTAL;			58.9	\$17,375.50

HEBCO-128 Copeland Properties 18, L.P. Bankruptcy

Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295	9.0	\$2655.00
TOTAL:			9.0	\$2655.00

HEBCO-130 Tri Tool Inc. v. Copeland, et al.

Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295	.2	\$59.00
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	1.9	\$560.50
TOTAL:			2.1	\$619.50

HEBCO-131 Shelton v. Copeland, et al.

John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	1.1	\$324.50
TOTAL:			1.1	\$324.50

HEBCO-132 Ross v. Copeland, et al.

Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295	.4	\$118.00
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	.7	\$206.50
TOTAL:			1.1	\$324.50

26 | | | | | |

|| || || || || ||

/////

HEBCO-133	German	American	Capital	Corp.	v. Co	peland
-----------	--------	-----------------	---------	-------	-------	--------

Everett G. Barry	Partner	\$295	2.2	\$649.00
John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	3.1	\$914.50
Patrick L. Prindle	Sr. Counsel	\$295	.6	\$177.00
TOTAL:			5.9	\$1740.50

HEBCO-137 Telesis Community Credit Union v. Copeland

John H. Stephens	Of Counsel	\$295	.5	\$147.50
TOTAL:			.5	\$147.50

3. Costs

Mulvaney Barry requests that the Court approve \$366.33 in costs. Summarized below are the out-of-pocket costs incurred. A detailed listing of each expense is summarized at the end of each sub-matter in Exhibit A. Mulvaney Barry charges \$.15 per page for copies. The messenger category includes court messenger services, hand delivery charges and FedEx or other overnight services. The filing fees category includes court filing fees, recording fees, and other state statutory fees.

DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
Messenger	\$ 91.75
Computerized Research	\$ 77.06
OnTrac Superior Court California	\$ 32.40
Conference Calls	\$ 24.10
Transportation	\$ 102.00
Pacer	\$ 25.52
Transcripts	\$ 13.50
Total:	\$ 366.33

A LAMINE DE LIT TA TOOR AND THE CONTROLL ON WEST A STREET
SAN DIEGO, CALLPCRINK SC101-7844
TELEPHONE 919 238-1901
FACSIMILE 619 238-1981

IV.

THE REQUESTED FEES ARE REASONABLE AND SHOULD BE ALLOWED

As described above, at the Receiver's request, Mulvaney Barry addressed numerous complex legal issues facing the Receivership Entities at the outset of the receivership. Among other things, the firm assisted the Receiver in:

- (a) Investigating the assets and liabilities of the Receivership Entities:
- (b) Developing and implementing strategies to maximize asset values and minimize administrative expenses;
- (c) In a short period of time, represent the Receiver in obtaining the Court's approval of his First Interim Application; and
- (d) Stabilizing a volatile situation in which the status of the Limited Partnerships vis-à-vis the receivership was unclear, and certain limited partners sought to separate from the receivership.

As is often the case in regulatory receiverships, the complexity and urgency of legal issues at the outset of the case warrants the use of more experienced attorneys. The work by Mulvaney Barry was performed at the discounted hourly rate of \$295.00 approved by this Court, and within 19 days of the firm being retained by the Receiver. The three primary attorneys, Everett G. Barry, John H. Stevens, and Patrick L. Prindle have been practicing approximately 39, 34, and 33 years, respectively. The Mulvaney Barry hourly rate for those attorneys has been reduced to \$295, and is very reasonable considering the skill and experience of its attorneys.

The skill and experience of Mulvaney Barry in complex litigation, bankruptcies and receiverships, corporate and real estate transactions,

and banking and finance was of great value and allowed the firm to efficiently represent the Receiver and the Receivership Entities. The requested fees and costs are reasonable and should be approved.

IV.

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, Mulvaney Barry respectfully requests an order:

- 1. Applicant has incurred \$23,187.00 in fees and \$366.33 in costs during the Application period. Applicant requests approval of payment of 75% of the fees on an interim basis the amount of \$17,390.25 plus \$366.33 in costs, for a total of \$17,756.58 from available Receivership assets in Copeland Wealth Management (Copeland Realty), Copeland Wealth Management (Copeland Financial) and/or the Copeland Fixed Income Funds. This interim reward would result in the Court retaining jurisdiction over the balance of Applicant's fees of 25% for further order of the Court. Given the discounted rates previously approved by the Court and the value of the services rendered, Applicant believes that this interim payment of 75% of Applicant's fees is warranted and appropriate; and
 - 2. Granting such other and further relief as is appropriate.

DATED: June 1, 2012

MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP

By: <u>/s/ Everett G. Barry, Jr.</u> Everett G. Barry, Jr., Attorneys for Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent Receiver

HEBCO.125.316867.1

EXHIBIT A

Case 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB Document 73-1 Filed 06/01/12 Page 2 of 33 Page ID #:1176

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:17 PRO FORMS, STATEMENT AS OF 933112 FOR FILE (HERCO-190) HERCO/General

#324731(107833) Page 1 (1)

General - Copeland Receivership

----- GELLIRG INSTRUCTIONS-----
General

----CLIENT INFORMATION----
Thomas C. Hebrank

--CLIENT NUMBER--

----CLIENT ADDRESS----
Thomas C. Hebrank
Permanent Receiver
501 West Broadway, Suite 800
8an Diego, CA 92101
-----WATTER INFORMATIOH----

				WOR	KED		CEED			
INDEX	INIT	DATH	STAT	HOURD	MUUUNA	enter	AMOUNT?	рнаяв	TASK ACTIVITY	DRACKILLION
76950	7 EGB	03/09/12	E.	1.40	413.00	1.40	413.00		х.	Further briefing and review of Receiver's pleadings dated Pebruary 21, 2012 and Receiver's response (.7). Prepare for and meeting with Tom Hebrank re status of Receivership and Order dated March 5, 2012 (.7).
76950	9 EGB	03/12/12	В	0.60	177,00	0.60	177.0	0	Æ	Rewills with Receiver re status/recention (.3); review case docket (.3).

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:17 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 053112 FOR FIER (HEBCO-100) HERCO/General

#324731(107833) Page 2 (2)

769510	EGE	03/12/12 B	1.90	560.50	1.90	\$60,50	A	Prepare for and meeting with Receiver and former counsel for Receiver (Attorney Ted Fatts) re pending Receivership matters and background of Defendant's businesses.
769512	eca	03/13/12 B	2.00	295.00	1.00	295.00	A	Prepare for and meeting with Receiver re retention and pending matters.
769515	EGE	03/13/12 8	9.80	236.00	0.80	236.00	A	Preparation and filing of Motice of Retention as General Counsel.
769519	203 3	03/13/12 B	Q.80	23.5.00	0.80	236,00	Ä	Meeting with Receiver to execute Notice of Retention; analyze contact by Attorney for Limited Partnership and response;
769521	RGS	03/13/12 B	0.30	68.50	0.30	89.50	Σe	Review neveral emails from Accorneys for Limited Partimus and Flagstar Bank re Receivership.
769522	KGB	03/13/12 8	0.30	98.50	0.30	88.50	A	Telaphone call to and telaphone call from Richard Ripperman (Trustee for RMI) re claims and potential settlement.
770196	JHS	03/13/12 B	1.00	295.40	1.00	255.01	Ç.	Review Orders from Court re appointment of counsel; conference with Attorney Earry ra Notice of Appointment; meeting with Attorney Barry and Attorney Frindle re case status and issues.
770192	JNS	03/14/ER B	0.20	59.60	0,20	59.00	ħ	Conference with Attornay Prindle re sub-matters to be evaluated.
768945	PLÞ	03/24/12 8	4.70	1,386.50	4.70	1,386.50	A	Review Court docket and pleadings tiled in various litigated satters.
758946	9T.P	03/14/12 8	1.50	442.50	1.50	442.50	c	Case administration re compliance with SRC's SPAR.
769525	SCIPS .	03/15/12 8	8.49	%18.00	0.40	110.00	A	Rmails with Receiver re Fee Application; Rmply to Opposition.

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:17 PRO FORMA STREEMENT AS GE 033112 FOR PILS (HEBCO-106) MEBCO/General

#324731 (107833) Page 3 (3)

768948	PLP	03/25/12 0	6.08	1,770.00	\$.0Q	1,770.00	c .	Review Receiver's First Fea Application(.6); review Fiagstar objections to Receiver's First Fea Application (1.6); preparation re Reply To Objections To Receiver's First Fea Application (3.6).
769528	EGR	03/18/12 B	Q.1Q	88,50	0.30	88.50	A	Telephone conference with Receiver re potential claim on Copeland Professional Liebility Policy and meeting with Real Estate Advisors.
769529	BOB	03/18/12 8	0,30	88.50	01.0	88.50	Ċ	Analyze content of Reply to Objections to Pee Application.
769418	SGB	03/16/12 B	1.20	354.00	1,20	354.00	8	Propage for and conference call with Attorneys for Plagatar Bank re Opposition to inclusion of partnership in Receivership; Opposition to Receiver's Fee Application.
770185	Jus	03/16/12 8	0,90	265.50	9.90	265.50	₹*	Review small from Attorney Barry re information needed for Reply to Opposition to Fee Application; meeting with Attorney Barry re same; conference with Attorney Priddle re revisions to Reply; prepare small to T. Hebrank re meeting with real estate group and possible insurance coverage
768950	PLP	03/16/12 8	4.10	1,209.50	K. IO	1,209.50	C	Proparation re reply to CP-18 Partners' Opposition To First Interim Fee Application (3.6); reteive and review transcript of Pebruary 6, 2012 hearing (.3).
770573	1000	03/17/12 8	6.20	235,00	0.80	235.00	Α	Email from Receiver, initial neview of Professional Liability Policy for Copeland Accounting; small to Receiver.
170574	BG B	63/17/12 8	0.36	68.50	0.30	88,50	A	Emeils with Receiver re Plagacar claim for legal fees
7595)0	SGR	09/19/12 8	0.30	88,50	0.30	88.50	Ä	Review and execute Notice of Change of Attorney information

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:17 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-100) HEBCO/General

#324731 (107833) Page 4 (4)

								re SEC litigation.
770182	JES	03/19/12 8	0.80	235.90	0.80	236.00	E.	Review email from Attorney Barry is tender of insurance coverage; raview insurance Folicy received from T. Hebrank; prepare email to T. Hebrank is possible basis for coverage.
770184	JKS	03/19/12 8	0.80	236,00	0.80	236,00	e	Review drafts of Raply in Support of Fee Application and Rebrank declaration; confarence with Attorney Prindle re complaint; exchange email with Attorney Sarry re reply.
768963	PLP	03/19/12 6	3,20	944.00	3.20	944,70	c	Preparation re Declaration In Support of Reply To Opposition To First Enterim For Application (2.3); telephone conference with Tom Hebrank re Reply To Opposition(.2); review and revise Reply To Opposition To First Interim Fee Application (.7).
769535	ekib	03/21/12 8	0.50	147.50	0.50	147,59	E.	Telephone conference with Receiver re Flagstar and CF-10 Objections to Fee Application (.3); email to Attorney Fates re pending matters (.2).
769536	808	03/21/12 B	0.40	118.00	0,40	%IS.00	F	Telephone conference with Attorney for Flagstar re Receiver's Reply and Withdrawal of Objection to Receiver's Fee Application.
769537	20 13	03/22/12 B	Q.70	206.50	0.70	204.59	A	Review draft Retention Letter for Tax Accountants (Lavins Loignen); enail to Receiver re same.
769539	969	03/22/12 8	0.30	68.69	0.30	86.50	A	Emails re telephone conference with SEC.
769540	PGB	03/22/12 B	0.00	235.00	0.80	236.00	A.	Review and analyse pending matters and project allocations.
759541	ega	03/23/12 8	0.20	59.00	0.20	\$9.00	A	Meeting with Receiver re potential claim on Copeland Exclessional Liability Policy

DATE: 6	5/23/12	13:43:17 P00 P	orma stadement	AS OF 013112	kok ethe	(HBBCQ-100)	HESCO/General	#324731(107833) Page 5 (5)
76934	9 8GB	03/23/22 B	0.50	147.50	0.50	147.50	A	General administration - meeting with Receiver re receivership matters.
76935) RCB	03/22/12 8	0.90	265.50	0.95	265.50	25	Review supplemental pleadings from Attorney for Flagstar withdrawing Objection to Pee Application (.4); review Fee Application issues with Receiver and Attorney fates (.3); analyse contact with Attorney for Copeland Properties Tan, L.F. re withdrawal of Objection (.2).
759229	i yele	03/73/12 B	Ø.40	118.00	0,45	3.34.00	¢	Receive and review Plagetar Bank Supplemental Objection To First Interim Fee Application; telephone call to Attorney Tooke re CP-10 Objection To First Interim Application; preve omail to Attorney Tooks te Objection To First Laterim Application.
769799	JKS	03/24/12 B	0.30	68.50	0.30	88.50	F	Review Notice of Beceivership and injunction filed with Court re SEC litigation.
769377	RGR	03/26/12 8	0.00	265.50	0.90	265.50	Á	Prepare for and conference call with SEC Actorneys Spencer Sendell and David Rosen re Receivership issues.
769378	BGB	03/26/13 B	σ.50	147,50	9.50	147.52	Ÿ	Follow-up on Withdrawel of Objection to Receiver's Fee Application by cerbain Copeland Properties Ten Limited Partners
769807	753	03/26/12 8	0.50	147,50	0.50	347.50	À	Review smail from T. Hebrank, re possible insurance coverage and contact with C. Copeland; prepara smail re same.
769809	JHS	03/26/12 B	0.40	118,00	0.40	118.00		Review Order Approving Receiver

59.00

0.20

59.00

769266 PLP

03/25/12 8

0.20

and indentifying entities subject to Receivership; review pending litigation re same.

Actorney Tooke se CP-10 Opposition to First Interim

application.

Follow up and telephone call to

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:17 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FIRE (HEBCD-109) HEBCO/General

#324731(107833) Page 6 (6)

late filed pleadings.

769435	RGB	03/27/12 B	1.00	295,00	1.00	295,00	P	Review Supplemental Objection by Copeland Properties Ten Simited Partners; analyze and review Receiver's Reply.
769828	EHD	03/27/12 B	Ø, 50	236.00	0.80	\$26.00	C	Conference with Attorney Barry re Supplemental objections to Ruceiver's Application and proposed Order; prepare revisions to Reply in Support of Receiver's tee application; conference with Attorney Prindle de same.
769407	ACB	03/27/12 8	2,26	649.00	2.20	649.00	c	Telephone call to Attornay Tooke re CP-1G Partners' Objection To First Interim Application (.1); receive and teview CP-1G Partners' Supplement To Objection To First Interim Application (.3); receive and review CP-1G partners' Proposed Order (.1); prepare Reply To Supplements To Objections filed by Flagster Bank and CP-1G Partners (1.7).
769491	PIP	03/29/12 B	6.20	51.00	0.20	9.00	С	Prepare email to Tom Hebrank attaching copies of Reply to Supplements To Objections filed by Plagster and CP-10 Partners (.2).
769493	PLP	03/28/12 B	2.76	796.90	3.79	796.50	F	Review Joint Application For Order Determining Good Faith of Settlement And Order filed by Conston and Thde (.4); review email to/from Attorney Haley re Case Management Conference (.1); review 3/21/12 letter and enclosures from Attorney Haley re Case Management Statement (.3); review 3/15/12 letter and proposed settlement agreement (.6); review Reorganisation Agreement re Rancho Mirage surgical Centers, EEC (1.1).
769960	EGB	03/29/12 8	2.30	383.50	1.30	393.50	C	Analyze response to Objection to Fee Application by Attorney Quinian; newisw response with Receiver; analyze grounds for further action on continued

DAME:	09/23/10	23:43:22	PRO PERMA	STITLE PARKET!	AS O	F 033112	POR	PILE	(MRGCG-100)	HRBCO/General	
-------	----------	----------	-----------	----------------	------	----------	-----	------	-------------	---------------	--

#326731(107633) Paign 7 (7)

769839	JH8	03/29/12 8	1.30	383.50	1.30	363.50	C	Analyze joinder by counsel for CP2 partners to objections; conference with Attorney Barry re basis for reply and revised proposed order; prepare revisions to Reply; conference with Attorney frindle re reply and terms for orders; prepare easil to T. Hebrank re hearing.
769659	FLP	03/29/12 8	5.70	1,681.50	5.70	1,681.50	C	Receive and review Joinder Eiled by Attorney Quinlan [1.6]; prepare Reply To Joinder [3.7]; prepare revised proposed Order [.4].
763948	SRR	03/29/12 8	0.50	147.50	0.50	147.50	c	Research re joinder of motions and/or oppositions filed by Actorney Quinlan.
770142	5GB	03/30/12 8	0.50	147.50	0.50	147.50	A	Work on service list (1); email to Receiver re BCP pervice of documents (.2).
770270	jus	03/30/12 B	0.30	18,50	0.30	88.50	A	Review small from T. Hebrark re mesting to identify collectable accounts receivable; conference with Attorney Sarry re same
770225	PLO.	03/30/12 B	1.90	\$95.QD	1.00	295.00	e	Telephone call from attorney Sendell re proposed order (.1); follow-up re filing/lodging proposed order (.5); telephone call to Judicial Clerk Horrell re fiting/lodging pleadings (.1); follow-up re lodging copies of pleading with Judge (.3).

Fee Subtotal

17379.50

(Riverside)

Unite TimeRespor Description Index Code Yalus ANA code

03/28/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR. Onfrac - (HEBCO-100) Superior 185387 CAOVER 10.80 1 10.80 Court of California

Case 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB Document 73-1 Filed 06/01/12 Page 9 of 33 Page ID #:1183

DATS: 05/23/12 12:43:17 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 BOM FILE (HEBCO-100) HEBCO/General

\$324731(107833) Page 8 (6)

03/28/12 EVERETT G. SARRY, JR.	OnTrac - (HBBCO-100) Superior Court of California (Indio)	185388 PAOVER	£0.80	T.	10.80
03/28/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR.	OnTrac - (MESECO-100) Superior Court of California (Sacramento)	185389 CAOVER	10.80	ı	10,80
03/15/12 REX B. BEATTY	Document Expense - Cindy Mirenberg - Transcript of Hearing 2/6/12	185049 DOCS	13.50	1	13.50
03/26/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR.	AT&T TeleConference Services - Teleconference Expense (HEBCO-100)	185573 HCOST	10.20	age de la companya de	10.20
03/16/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR.	ATAT TeleConference Services - Teleconference Expense (HEBCO-100)	185671 HCOST	13.90	ī	13.90
93/30/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR.	Knox Attorney Service for court services - Report Expense (HESCO-100)	185464 RASC	91.75	â	91.75
03/16/12 EVERETT Q. BARRY, JR.	Pacer Service -Search Expense	185434 SEARCH	1.29	1	1.28
03/14/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR.	Pacer Service -Search Expense	185439 SEARCH	24.24	3	24.24
03/29/12 EVERETT G. BARRY, JR.	Thomson West - Search Expense (MRBCO-100)	185412 SEARCH	77.06	1	77.06
03/36/12 John K. Sterhens	Trunsportation Expense to hearing	185309 TRAVEL	102.00	<u>*</u> .	102.00

COST TOTAL:

366.33

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:17 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (H9ECO-100) HEBCO/General

#324731(107833) Page 9 (9)

LEDGER SUMMARY: ALL OPEN INVOICES AND INVOICES SINCE 02/01/2012

	BALANCE DUE	S PROM P	REVIOUS	STATE	MERT	6 8 8 9	9 7 8 8	¥ .	0.00
	LESS PAYMEN	PP (9)	v 4 8			22.2	2.00		0.00
								0.00	
	BALANCE FOR	KWARD .	* * *			F + 2	1 W 1	v .w	0.00
	TIMECARD SO	de-Yotal,	(58.	90) .	ec 30 (e. (e. (e.)	(e) (i) (i) (i)	. 1731	16.50	
	DISBURSIMEN	er sua-e	PÉAL .	4 × 8)		0 : 2 :	36	66.33	
	SUBTOTAL CU	BRRNT P	ZR-100				1.774	11.03	
	TOTAL BUE	h + 9 =	* * P	r - 6			1974	2 B	17741.03
	TIME VALUE	POR THE	HATTER	AFTER	THE CUIO	F DATE	a with a		3166.00
	COST VALUE	POR THE	MATTER	apter	THE CUTOR	F DATE	(6.19)(152.9)	8.2	197.69
*	u so de en object de mé gring en ed	(w- a-vy -v -v -v -v -v -v		TIME A	NO PER SUP	MARY			***************
* ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~	Timereps	Q ,		RATE	HOURS		FEEE	3 €	COSTS
SVERETT	G. BARRY, J	ne.		299.00	19,20	32.6	5664.00	32.6	250,83
JOHN H.	STEPHENS			295,00	7.30	12.4	2153.50	12.4	102.00
PATRICK	L. PRINDLE			295.00	31.90	54.2	9410.50	54.2	.00
STACY H.	RUBIN			295.00	.50	. 9	147.50	9 .9	.00
REE B. B	BATTY			.00	.00	.0	.00	0.0	13.50
		TX	PLATE		58.90		17375.90	3	366.33
					30.30				
CAOVER DOOS HCOST KASC PACER SEARCH	COST CODS COST CODS California Document Sx Knox Attorn Pacer Servi Seaxch Expe Transportat	Gwernigi pense toy Servi	ie To:	uly has all you to to a	as age of age to an are an age of age of age on are an age of				
CAOVER DOCS HCOST KASC PACER SEARCH TRAVEL	Cost coss California Document Sx Knox Attorn Pacer Servi Seaxoh Expe Transportati Tal.	Overnight pense toy Service the Service Servic	ic To: ice for mee	court	estvicas		32.49 13.50 24.10 91.75 25.52 77.06 102.00	Credit	Applied To
CAOVER DOCS HCOST KASC PACER SEARCH TRAVEL COST TOT	Cost coss California Document Sx Knox Attorn Pacer Servi Seaxoh Expe Transportati Tal.	Overnight overni	ic To: ice for mee	Court	stricts	Cob	32.49 13.50 34.10 91.75 25.52 77.06 102.00	Credit	Applied To

CATE: 05/23/12 L3-43:L7 FRO FORMA STATEMENT AS DE CITIZ FOR FILE (HEBCO-100) HEBCO/General

#324731(1078331 Page 10 10

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:20 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-128) CopelandPropertles18, #324732(107833) Page 11 (1)

---- BILLING INSTRUCTIONS----
North Carolina Bankruptcy

----CLIENT INFORMATION----
Thomas C. Hebrank

--CLIENT NUMBER--

*....*CLIENT ADDRESS----*
Thomas C. Hebrank
Permanent Receiver
501 West Broadway, Suite 800
San Diego, CA 92101

---- MATTER INFORMATION----

INDEX	INIT	DATE	STAT		HOURS	AMOUNT		AMOUNT	PHASE TO	ask activity	DESCRIPTION
76941	2 EGB	03/14/12	B	*	1.70	501.50	1.70	501.50		F	Prepare for and conference call with Attorney Adams (North Carolina Bankruptcy Counsel) re Lender's Motion to Dismiss Bankruptcy; analyze response by Receiver; follow-up telaphone conference with Receiver.
76941	4 EGB	03/16/12	.в		Q.40	118,00	0.40	118.00	i)	Ř	geview and analyze series of emails to potential dismissal of the bankruptoy: analyze

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:20 PRS FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FIEE (HEBCO-128) CopelandPropertice18, \$324732(107833) Page 12 (2)

								response of Receiver.
77057 5	868	03/17/12 B	0.50	147.50	0.90	147.50	P	Several emails from Attorney Adams: analyze response to terms of dismissal proposal.
759417	ega	03/19/12 8	0,50	147.50	0.50	147.50	g.	Telephone conference with Receiver re Motion to Dismiss and Receiver's response; telephone call to Attorney Adams,
769418	EGB	03/20/12 B	0.80	236.90	9.50	236.00	¥	Prepare for and telephone conference with Attorney Adams re pending Morion to Dismiss; taiaphone call to Receiver re response.
769533.	863	G1/21/12 B	0.80	236.00	0.80	236.00	P	Telephone conference with Ruceiver re response to Motion to Dismiss by Lendar (.4); telephone conference with Attorney Adams to Receiver's position at Hearing on Motion (.4); emails from Attorney Adams.
769533	KGB	03/21/12 B	0.70	206,50	0.70	206.50	¥.	Raview and analyze response of BA to Morion to Dismiss with cover email from Attornay Adams.
769534	FIR	03/21/12 8	0.50	147.50	0.50	147.50	Î.	Review proposed response to Motion to Dismiss by Receiver; email to Actorney Adams with suggested revisions.
769538	rce	03/22/12 B	0.60	177.00	0.60	177.00	聲	Review email from Attorney Adams re results of Hearing: email to Actorney Adams re payments.
769352	PCE	93/23/12 B	1.20	354,08	1.20	354.00	V	Several emails from and to Attorney Adams we results of Hearing on Motion to Dismiss; review proposed Order; review results of Hearing with Receiver and Attorney Fates.
769386	RGS.	03/25/13 8	0.80	236.00	0.00	236.00	37 4	Smalls with Attorney Adams re payments per Order of Dismissal.
779090	208	03/30/12 8	0.30	88.50	0.30	88.50	E	Several amails from Actorneys Adams and McAfee re dismissal

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:20 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (H2BCO-128) CopelandPropertiae18, #324732(107833) Page 13 (3)

issues.

770139 EGB 03/30/12 B

0.20

59.00

0.20 59.00

10

Emmils from Actorneys Adams and McAfee re payments.

Fee Subtotal

2655.00

Sate Timekeeper

Description

Endez

Code

Value ABA code

LEDGER SUMMARY: ALL OPEN ENVOICES AND INVOICES STACE 02/01/2012

	BALAZ	NCE .	DUE	PE	lOI	и р	ERV	TO	OCH	8	T	VTE	340	HEAT.	r	v				÷	Ŷ		100				×			0.00	
	LESS	PAV	MIKN	rp (s	1			.00			121	/20		-				, and						Ų.						0.00	
	DECO10	0.134																		-									-		×
	NAAR	NGR	FOR	WAS	(O		90	(e);	eï	*	×	Ţ		+		×	æ	(0.7	63	*		٠	7	e,		7	ř			0.00	
	TIME	CARD	50	m - 1	מי	PAL	ſ		9.	00	0		ě	*	P	×	į		ř.	ě.		3			26	85	.00				
	DISBU	RSE	MEN	rr s	ch	1 - 24	איני	ı.	ě.	9	¥			9	¥	¥			$\tilde{k}_{i}^{(i)}$	×	Ä	98				0	.00				
	SUBTY	ANTC	CU	RRE	RT.	r Pi	RI	300)	4			43	2	¥	ů,			¥1		4			3	26	55	.00				
	TOTA	r DO	E	₹.	5	. 4	•	6		Ŷ.	ŝ	٠	60	*	*	ij	i e	140	83	÷	í,		74	E	67	*	9		261	55.00	E.
	TIME	VAL	UE	FOI	6 4	THE	642/4	T	ER	1 2		PRE	È 1	r'EU	de l	CU	ro	FF	0)		e.								1	29.50	100
	COST	VAG																												0.00	
*																		HE CA									1.5			cos	
*	TI	MEKE	EPE	R	-		m/m/m	Cris M				TT				UR				t				lie.	RE			ŧ			0.000
EVERETT	G. 8/	ARRY	4 4	R.						25	5	00)		9	.0	0	100	0.0	0							100	1.0			.00
						T	YEA	LS	7						3	. 0	0						26	55	.0	0				3	.00
				-14	XXX	JER.	SU	140	CAR	Y-											N. A.										
Ledger C																Lt:					re									plies	
*******		4	0.000					-							• •					*			-0			0	**	C C C	***		
												(#)				-				• •	••	*1*	*								
TOTAL														ĕ	. 0	0					0.	00									

DATE: 09/21/12 12:43:20 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR VIDE (MEBCO-178) TepelandPropertiests. #324/12/10/0331 Page 14 (4)

Case 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB Document 73-1 Filed 06/01/12 Page 16 of 33 Page ID #:1190

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:21 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-130) TriToolIng. VCP3

#324733 (107833) Page 15 (1)

* - - - MATTER DESCRIPTION ----*

Tri Tool Inc. v. CP3

...-BILLING INSTRUCTIONS----
Bacto Superior Court

******CLIENT INFORMATION

Thomas C. Hebrank

--CLIENT NUMBER--

----CLIENT ADDRESS----
Thomas C. Hebrank
Permanent Receiver
501 West Broadway, Suite 800
San Diego, CA 92101

----MATTER INFORMATION----

WORKED

DILTERD

THDEX INIT DATE STAT HOURS AMOUNT BOOKS AMOUNT PHASE TASK ACTIVITY
769757 JHS 03/22/12 B 0.86 236.00 0.80 236.00 F

DESCRIPTION

Analyze Tri Tool's proposed Joinder in Sx Parte Application for hearing on Motion to Continue Trial and reopen discovery, Ex Parte Application, Proposed Order, Motion, Points and Authorities and Declaration re same; telephone call to Tri Tool's counsel re stay and proposed joinder.

DATE:	05/2	23/12	13:43:21	PRO	PORMA	STATEMENT	as of	033112	FOR PILE	(HBB-00-130)	Trifooling, vCP3	#324733(107833) Page 1	(2)
769	363	EGB	63/23/1	2 B		0.20	59	.00	0.20	59.00	*	Meeting with Roceiver a Accorney Pates to respo Tri-Tool lawsuic and up Case Management Confer	poming
769	784	ЈНЗ	03/23/1	28		0.20	59	.00	0.20	59,00	Ė	Meeting with T. Hebran prior counsel re case and strategy we Tri To litigation.	status
769	825	<i>о</i> ня	03/27/1	2 B		0.20	59	. 00	0,40	118.00	₽	Propare Substitution o re CP-3.	f counsel
770	1,68	лнэ	03/30/1	2 8		0.50	147	.50	0.50	147.50	F	Review interrogatory r from L. Franklin.	esponses
		Fee	Subtotal				61	9.50				÷	

Date Timekeeper

Description

Index Code

Value ABA code

LEDGER SUMMURY: ALL OPEN INVOICES AND INVOICES SINCE 02/01/2012

BALANCE DUE FROM PREVIO	US STATEMENT	× , ,		9/3/FE	0.00
				04 E 4 E	0.00
BALANCE FORWARD	8 x x = m x s			6116 K K K	0.00
TIMECARD SUB-TOTAL (2.10)	(De 100 (10)	8 x = 8	619.50	
DISBURSEMENT SUB-TOTAL			$a \times x \in \mathcal{S}$	0.00)
SUBTOTAL CURRENT PERIO				619.50	3
TOTAL DUE			* * * *	E 1 1 2 9	619.50
TIME VALUE FOR THE MAP	DER AFTER THE	GUTTO FIF	DATE		1652.00
COST VALUE FOR THE LOAD	TER AFTER THE	SQUEETS.	DATE	e e e E e	44.00
	TIME AND F	BE SUMM	\RY		
tTIMEKREPER		OURS	\$	PERS	t COSTS
EVERBTT G. BARRY, JR.	295,00	.20	9.5	59.00	9.5 .00

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:21 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-LIG) Triteoline. VCP3

8424744(137831) Pags 17 13

John L. STER	BMS	295:00	1.40	90.5	550.00	315	0.00
	TOTALS		2-10		619.50		÷05
	LEDGER SUMMAL	}Y~ =====		A COLUMN TO	******		
Ledgar Code	Leager Gestriptiv	ì	Dobi-	red	it (Credit 3	Applied To
****							* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
					. 6 4		
1700946			0.00	0 0	id :		

Case 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB Document 73-1 Filed 06/01/12 Page 19 of 33 Page ID #:1193

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:21 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR PLLS (HEBCO-131) HenryShelton, etalv.Co #324734(107833) Page 18 (1)

----MATTER DESCRIPTION----

----BILLING INSTRUCTIONS----

Henry Shelton, et al v. Charles Copeland, et al

Riverside Superior Court

*----CLIENT INFORNATION-----

-- CLIENT NUMBER ---

Thomas C. Hebrank

REBCO

----CLIENT ADDRESS----

Thomas C. Hebrank Permanent Receiver 501 West Broadway, Suite 600 San Diego, CA 92101

* ---- MATTER INFORMATION ----*

WORKED

BILLED

THREE THREE STAT HOURS AMOUNT BOORS AMOUNT PHASE TASK ACTIVITY

DESCRIPTION

Review small from counsel in Shelton case re proposed stipulation to continue Trial Setting Conference; review proposed stipulation; exchange email with P. Prindle re some and filing revised Motice of Stay; prepare email to counsel re same, telephone call from R. Ziprick re non-opposition to motion for continuance.

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:21 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-131) HenryShelton, etalv. Co #324734 (107833) Page 19 (2)

Fee Subtotal

324.50

Date Timekeeper

Description

Index Code

Value ABA code

LEDGER SUMMARY: ALL OPEN INVOICES AND INVOICES SINCE 02/01/2012

BALAN	CE COR	PRO	el Pi	SEA.	cous	S 9	TA	TE	KEN	T	F	9	27		÷	ä	4	ě.	$\hat{\mathbf{z}}^{(i)}$	ŵ.	ď	4		0	.00
6889	PAYMEN	T(S)	*		s ar	4	F		e /#o	*	*		¥			4	41	8		ÿ	×	×		0	.00
BALAN	CE FOR	WARE	Ē a	ŧ	* #	÷	ji.	4 3	y b	,	à.		ić.	*		æ	30	0	¥.	w.	ě	28		0	.00
TIMEC	ARD SU	8-20	TAL	Ţ.	L	. to	1	160		9	50	,	10	×	3	4				12	4.	50			
orsao	RSEMEN	T SU	E-R	YTA		×		e.			(6)	e.			÷		ž.				0,	00			
SUBTO	TAL CU	RREN	T PI	SRIC	20	8	413	10				E	8							32	4.	50			
TOTAL	DOS	5 (8)	* 125	10		it.	4	K.		ď		٠	ř	Ţ	ě	4		Š	ķ.		2	w		324	.50
TIME	VALUE	KOR	THE	MA	TER	R A	FT	ER	TH	R	CU	ros	e F	DH	C27	12		2			¥	(4)		501	.50
COST	MALDE	POR :	THE	MAY	TE	4 5	PT	BR	TH	B :	CU	EOI	P W	£93	YEI	ß		×	*	(4)	(6)			0	.00
						TT-	мв	IA.	ND.	e e	E :	aus	ti-tir	R	t										
мхт	EKEEPE	R			. *		RA	TE		но	UR.	8		1					50				\$		COSTS
они и, этери	ens					29	5.	QQ.		1	.1	0 7	LOG	. (2			3;	34	.50		raa	.0		-00
			T	TA	B					1	.1	0						33	24	. 50	3				.00
,		- CRD	OER	SU	има	RY-																			
edger code	Ledge	er D	esci	ripi	Lion	à.			D	ab	it				C	cee	tti	1			¢	red	it	Appl	ied T
						-									2	4 6					*			4.0	* 4 10 10 1
													5			0,2									

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:21 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 03:112 FOR FILE (HBBCG-131) HencyShelson, etaly. Co #534734(10/833) Page 20 13:

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:22 PRO PORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-132) ROWG, MelvynaRuth

#334735(107833) Page 21 (1)

ROSS, Melvyn and Ruth

*---*BILLING INSTRUCTIONS----*
Claim \$350,000

----CLIENT INFORMATION-----
Thomas C. Rebrank

--CLIENT NUMBER--

enduda ar maranic

...-CLIENT ADDRESS----
Thomas C. Rebrank
Permanent Receiver
501 West Broadway, Suite \$00
San Diego, CA \$2101
----MATTER INFORMATION-----

		WORK	EU	BI	LEED			
INDEX INIT	DATE STAT	HOURS	ALC: COLORER		AVEJUNITY PI	hace task	ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION
769814 JHS	03/28/12 B	0.70	206.50	0.70	206.50		B	Review Motion for Good Faith Settlement; conference with Attorney Prindle re response; review letter from Ross' attorney re note from CP12.
770110 809	03/30/12 8	0.40	118.00	0.40	118.00		©	Basil from Receiver; review letter from CP-12 LP's Melvy and Ruth Rose; analyze response

Fee Subtotal

324,50

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:22 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 POR FIGE (MEBCO-132) Ross, MelvýneRuch

#324735(107833) Page 22 (2)

Date Timekeeper

Description

Index Code

Value ABA code

LEUGER SUMMARY: ALL OPEN INVOICES AND INVOICES SINCE 02/01/2012

BALANCE DUB FROM PREVIO	US	ST	TE	MEHP	r	ro 4	. 4	9	d	p.		3-	¥	by	ė	7		0.00
LESS PAYMENT(9)										ú	Ç.	ě.	ď.	4	*			0.00
																100		
BALANCE FORWARD	9		Ę			1 13	*	Ŷ	ĕ	ú	Si	4	6	õ	÷	*		0.00
TIMECARO SUB-TOTAL (1.1	0)	¥1			. 24		ĸ	v	(4)	÷			32	4.	50		
DISSURSEMENT BUB-TOTAL	× 14	(4)	i	(i)	(6 1	- 56		10	a.	×					٥.	00		
SUBTOTAL CURRENT PERIOD	1	190	*:				÷		96	×				32	4.	50		
TOTAL DUS	/E 135	(*)	F.	х ::	Œ 5	€ 9		*	×	٠	Ţ	٠	7.5	20	*;	*		324.50
TIME VALUE FOR THE MATT	ER	AF	RES	TH	EC	סיניט	FF	DJ	TI	3	à	ď		(4)	ě	-		177.00
The filtration of the Research Control	areas.	00 YM0	-			mma	COURSE.	1737	TTE	900				o.		10		0.00
COST VALUE FOR THE MATTI	ЬR	PLP I	CHSHC	TH	B C	UPG	2.0	De		•			ì	-				
(Т	IMI	. A	SID	FBE	294	New.	AR'	<i>(</i>				-					********
*	т	IMI RJ	A A	Silo	ROU	#U RS	(NOV)	AR'	<i>(</i>	-			FI	389			¥	COSTS
	Т	1M1 RJ	A TR	NID	PBE HOU	#U RS 40	3 i	AR*	/			1	F1	.00	:	36	¥ .4	costs
······································	T	IMI RJ	A TR	NID	PBE HOU	RS 40	31	AR*	/			1	F1	.00		36.	¥ .4	costs
TOTALS	2 2	IMI RJ 195	A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A A	SID	PRE HOU	RS 40 70	31	AR* 6.4	f t			111 20 3;	F1 18 36	.00	1	36	.4	COSTS .09 .09
TOTALS	2 2 1	IMI RJ 195	2 A	SiD	PBE HOU -	#U RS 40 70	31 6:	AR'	f			11 20 3:	F1 06 24	. 00)	36	* .4 .6	COSTS .09 .09
TIMEKEEPER	2 2 2 1 I	IMI RJ 195	2 A	NID	PBE HOU -	(#) RS 40 70	31 6:	AR'	f Cr	rai	di.	1.1 26 3;	F18 06 24	. 50 . 50	C	36 . 63	% .4 .6	COSTS .09 .09 .00
TIMEKEEPER* EVERETT G. BARRY, JR. TOHU H. STEPHENS	2 2 2 1 I	IMI RJ 195	2 A	NID	PRE HOU	70 10	31 6:	AR*	f	car	di.	1) 26 3;	F18 06 24	. 50 . 50	C	36 . 63	% .4 .6	COSTS .00 .00 .00

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:20 PRO MORMA SENTEMENT AS DE 033112 FOR FILE (DEBCO-1321 Ross, MelvynaRuth

#324735(L0/033) Page 21 (3)

DATE: 05/23/12 13:41:22 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-133) GermanAmericanCapital #324736(107833) Page 24 (1)

----MANTER DESCRIPTION----
German American Capital Corporation
v. Copeland

*----** Riverside Indio Case Inc 1102045

*******CLIENT INFORMATION

- CLIENT NUMBER --

Thomas C. Hebrank

RESCO

----CLIENT ADDRESS----
Thomas C. Hebrank
Permanent Receiver
501 West Broadway, Suite 800
San Diego, CA 92101

* ---- MATTER INFORMATION -----

				WORK	go Gg	BII	TRO			
INDEX	IMIT	DATE	STAT	HOURS	AMOUNT	HOURS	AMOUNT	PHASE TASI	K ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION
76952	4 ÉGB	03/13/12	В	0.90	265.50	0.90	265.5	0	P	Office conference to review pending matters and responses.
769526	S EXTE	03/15/12	В	0.30	88.50	0.30	86.S	0	ÿ	Review and analyze email from Recuiver re litigation plan; email to Receiver.
76952	7 RGB	03/15/12	В	g-30	88.50	0.30	88.5	0	P	Email letter from Attorney for German American Capital vs. Copeland Properties Twelve, L.P. re CP-12.

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:22 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR WILE (HESCO-133) GermanAmericanCapital #324736(107631) Page 25 (2)

776187	uns.	03/15/12 8	0.40	1.14.00	6.40	118.90	P	Review email from T. Hebrank re objections to Order approving expenses from partnership; review letter from counsel for Hotel Majestic re possible settlement.
768954	PLP	03/19/12 B	୯. ସେ	177.05	0.80	177-,00	¥	Review 1/15/12 letter from Attorney Haley to German American Capital Corp. v. CP-12 (.1); review 1/8/12 letter from Attorney Haley and analosed proposed settlement agreement and Reorganization agreement re resolution of German American Capital v. CP-12 litigation.
769389	939	03/23/12 8	0.70	206.50	0.70	206.50	ę	Asslyze Settlement Proposal; revise response to Settlement Proposal with Receiver and Attorney Pates.
769783	JHS	93/23/12 B	1,80	531.00	1.80	\$31.0G	¥	Review letter from Hotel Majestic's counsel re possible sattlements and terms; analyze and prepare revisions to draft Settlement Agreement; analyze related Reorganization Agreement; analyze CMC Statements from Majestic's rounsel and Conston's counsel; meeting with T. Hebrank re alternatives awaitable; prepare email to Majestic's counsel re effect of stay; review response re sume.
769198	JHS	e3/24/12 B	g.30	\$\$. 50	0.30	86,50	\$	Review Notice of Becelvership and injunction filed with Court, prepare Substitution of Counsel re German American Sank v Copleand
770183	J83	03/26/12 B	0.20	59.00	0,20	59.00	보	Seriew Case Management Statement from counsel for Thice and Conson.
769824	JBS	93/27/12 8	0.40	118.00	0.40	115.06	F	Review CMC Statement from counsel for Rancho Mirage Surgery and Physician's Surgery Center; prepare revisions to Substitution of Counsel.

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:22 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (REBCO-133) GermanAmericanCapital #324736(107833) Page 26 (3)

Fee Subtotal

1740.50

Date Timekeeper

Description

radex fod

Value ABA code

LEDGER SUPPARY: ALL OPEN INVOICES AND INVOICES SINCE 82/01/2012

	WE CUIT COCK	PREVIOUS	MELLIFATED	CHECKET.	16 12 17	20 17 9	9.3	10.00	1 6	0.00
usas P	MINUMITAL	37 320 th ts	* * * *		2.3.1					*****
BALANC	CE PORWARD	* 40 6 8	x = x =		3 O	e e s	e = 9	9.0	***	0.00
TIMECA	ARD SUB-TO	PAL (5.	901		201301	683		1740	.50	
DISBUR	REBNEWT SUE	-TOTAL .	8 8 300	2 K & K & A	90.00	n b s		0	.00	
SUSTOT	CAL CURRENT	DESTRUCT.			11 (6)			1740	.50	
JATOT	008		3 2 3 1			6.8		(A)	8	1740.50
TIME V	ALUS FOR T	HE MATTER	AFTER	THE CUTO	EF DA	TE .		ection y	0.56	1947.00
	ALUE FOR T									0.00
*TNE			TIME AN	ID FEE SU						COSTS
*TTM5	CREEPER	×	RATE	HOURS				PEES	*	COSTS
SVERETT G. BAR	CKERPER CRY, JR.		RATE 295.00	HOURS 2.20	37.3		64	9.00	37.3	COSTS
*TIME EVERETT G. BAR JOHN H. STEPHE	CREEPER RRY, JR. EMS	×	RATE 295.00 295.00	HOURS 2.20	37.3 52.5		64 91	9.80 9.80 4.50	37.3	COSTS .00 .80
TIME	CREEPER RRY, JR. EMS	·	RATE 295.00 295.00	1,20 3,10	37.3 52.5		64 91 17	9.80 9.80 4.50	37.3 52.5	COSTS .00 .80
EVERETT G. BAR JOHN H. STEPHE PATRICK L. PRI	erephr RRY, Jr. EMS	TOTALS	RATE 295.00 295.00 295.00	3,10 3,10 .60 5.90	37.3 52.5 10.2		64 91 17	9.80 4.50 7.00 0.50	\$ 37.3 52.5 10.2	.00 .80 .00
EVERETT G. BAR JOHN H. STEPHE PATRICK L. PRI	SKERPER KRY, JR. SENS CNDLS	TOTALS	RATE 295.00 295.00 295.00	HOCRS 2,20 3,10 .60 5,90	37.3 52.5 10.2		64 91 17 174	9.80 6.50 7.00 0.50	\$ 37.3 52.5 10.2	.00 .80 .00
EVERETT G. BAR JOHN H. STEPHE PATRICK L. PRI	EREPER	TOTALS	RATE 295.00 295.00	HOCRS 2,20 3,10 .60 5,90	37.3 52.5 10.2		64 91 17 174	PRES 3.80 4.50 7.00 0.50	37.3 52.5 10.2 Credit	.00 .00 .00
EVERETT G. BAR JOHN H. STEPHE PATRICK L. PRI	EREPER	TOTALS SER SUMMAR	RATE 295.00 295.00 295.00	ROURS 2,20 3,10 .60 5,90	37.3 52.5 10.2	Cred	64 91 17 174	PRES 3.80 4.50 7.00 0.50	37.3 52.5 10.2 Credit	.00 .00 .00 .00

DAIE: 05/23/12 13:13:22 PRO TORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO 1331 German/AmericanCapital #124736(167833) Page V7 (4)

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:23 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FIRE (HEBEO-137) TelesiaCommunityCredi #324737(107933) Page 28 (1)

----MATTER DESCRIPTION----
Talouis Community Credit Union
v. Copeland Properties Bight, L. P.

----BILLING INSTRUCTIONS-----
New York Supreme Court Case NO9-1988

Thomas C. Hebrank

--CLIENT NUMBER--

....CLIERT ADDRESS----
Thomas C. Hebrank
Permanent Receiver
501 West Sroadway, Suite 800

San Diego, CA 92101

	CESSEON		HIL	LIRO			

INDEX INT DATE STAT	HOURS	THILLIAM	ROURS	TANDOMA	PHASE TI	ASK ACTIVITY	DESCRIPTION
769835 JHS 03/28/12 B	0.50 10	47.50	0,50	147.50	Ç.	Р	Exchange email with T. Hebrank re correspondence with Judge in Telease case against Copeland Properties Sight LP.

Fee Subtotal

147.50

DATE: 05/23/12 13:43:23 PRO FORMA STATEMENT AS OF 033112 FOR FILE (HEBCO-137) TelegisCommunityCredi #324737(107833) Page 29 (2)

Date Timekeeper

Description

Index Code

Value ABA code

LEDGER SUMMARY: ALL OPEN INVOICES AND INVOICES SINCE 02/01/2012

	ALAN	CE D	UE	PRO	MC	pR	V3	IO	US	B	TI	VTE	M	NS:	P	4			93	v				20	$\tilde{\mathbf{x}}$					0.00
LE	ess	PAYM	BRY	r(S)		8				•			¥					ŷ		77	9	14			*	19			0.00
94	AGAN	CE P	OR	WAR!	D	ř				2		¥.	Ġ.			4			2.			Si		×	×)*			0,00
TI	IMEC	ARI)	gor	3-T(ATC	l.	Ç			50	1			*	٠					œ		9			1	17	.50			
DT	(SBU	взем	ENT	r st	JB -	ro	TA	K 4	8		*	p.	ĸ	16	÷				*			25				0	.00			
.90	вто	TAL	COL	RRE	WI.	PE	RI	OD			4		8	3					80						1	17	.50	8		
TO	YTAL	DÜR			3 11	•	0	Ť	7		97	e.	5	,	¥	ž		Ÿ	÷	*		'n	9	0		*	ě		1.4	7.50
TL		VALU	E E	POR.	TH	E (1	MA.	TT	BR	A	girit.	e i	L T	e d	SD 3	cu	or	FF	Q)	RAT!	E.	q.				S			2	9.50
(3))ŠT	VALU	8 1	MR	THI	2	MA	TT	BR	A	P	H	į į	CTE	8	CU	ro	FF	(0)	K.E.	K	ā	r	¥	Ÿ					0.00
*																		NEM,		¥-		••			RES					ereco
•	TIM	EKEE								j	RA	TE		\$	Ю	UR	g		1	k				21	RE	3		¥		ereon
	TIM	EKEE						. •	3	j	RA			\$	Ю	UR	9		1	k				17	.5	9				
•	-ТІМ НЧЭТ	ekee Ens	PBF	ł	•••	ro	TA	LS		29	R#	. 06	1	•	Ю	.5	S 0	10	0.0	U			1	17	.5	0	100	\$ 1. Q		.00
JOHN H. ST	-ТІМ ГЕРН	ekee ens	PBF	- FEI	oge ,	ro R	TA SOI	LS	AR	29	R#	. 06	1			.5	s o	10	0.0	œ U			1	17	.50	9	100	1.0		.00
JOHN H. ST	TIM TEPH	ekee ens	per dge	·LEI) Des	ro R	TA SUI	LS	AR	29	R#	. 06	1	D	os de	.5	9 0	10	0.0	C		**	1	17	.50	0	loc	i.o	App	.00
JOHN H. ST	TIM TEPH	EKEE ENS	per dge	·LEI) Des	ro R	TA SUI	LS	AR	29	R#	. 06		D	eb	.5 .5	s 0	10	0.0	C		di.	1	17	.50	0	loc	i.o	App	.00 .00