22

24

25

26

28

Everett G. Barry, Jr. (SBN 053119) John H. Stephens (SBN 82971) Patrick L. Prindle (SBN 87516) MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP 401 West A Street, 17th Floor San Diego, CA 92101-7994 Telephone: 619-238-1010 Facsimile: 619-238-1981

Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent Receiver

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA, WESTERN DIVISION

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION,

Plaintiff,

CHARLES P. COPELAND, COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL ADVISORY CORPORATION, AND COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A REAL ESTATE CORPORATION,

Defendants.

CASE NO. 11-cv-08607-R-DTB

NOTICE OF HEARING ON FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND COSTS TO THOMAS C. HEBRANK, PERMANENT RECEIVER

Date: March 18, 2013 Time: 10:00 a.m. Ctrm: 8, 2nd Floor

Judge: Hon. Manuel L. Real

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that on March 18, 2013, at 10:00 a.m. in Courtroom 8 of the United States District Court, 312 North Spring Street, Los Angeles, California, the Court will consider the Fifth Interim Application of Thomas C. Hebrank ("Receiver"), Court-appointed Permanent Receiver for Charles P. Copeland; Copeland Wealth Management, A Financial Advisory Corporation (Copeland Financial); Copeland Wealth Management, A Real Estate Corporation ("Copeland Realty"); and their subsidiaries and affiliates (collectively, the "Receivership Entities"), and certain professionals, for approval and payment of fees and costs.

The following table summarizes the fees incurred, interim payment requested, and costs requested for the period October 1, 2012, through December 31, 2012 ("Period") by the Receiver:

Applicant and Role	Fees Incurred	Interim Payment Requested	Costs	Total
Thomas C. Hebrank	\$86,485.50	\$64,864.13 (75%)	\$2,039.48	\$66,903.61

This notice, along with the fifth interim fee and cost application is posted on the Receiver's website (www.ethreeadvisors.com). A hard copy of the application can also be obtained by contacting the Receiver's office at (619) 400-4923.

If you oppose the application, you are required to file your written opposition with the Office of the Clerk, United States District Court, Central District of California, Western Division, 312 North Spring Street, Los Angeles, California 90012-4793, and serve the same on the undersigned, not later than twenty one (21) days before the date designated for the hearing.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the proposed Order Approving the Fifth Interim Fee Application of the Receiver, a true and correct copy of which is attached hereto as **Exhibit "A"** and by this reference made a part hereof, has been lodged with the above-entitled Court.

DATED: February 15, 2013 MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP

By: <u>/s/ Patrick L. Prindle</u>
Patrick L. Prindle, Attorneys for
Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent
Receiver

HEBCO.125.353385.1

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA, WESTERN DIVISION

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION,

Plaintiff,

٧.

18

19

20

21

CHARLES P. COPELAND, COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL ADVISORY CORPORATION, AND COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A REAL ESTATE CORPORATION,

Defendants.

CASE NO. 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB

ORDER APPROVING FIFTH
INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR
APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF
FEES AND COSTS TO THOMAS
C. HEBRANK

Date: March 18, 2013 Time: 10:00 a.m. Dept.: 8, 2nd Floor

Judge: Honorable Manuel L. Real

At the above time and date, the Court convened for the purpose of hearing the Fifth Interim Fee Application For Approval And Payment Of Fees And Costs To Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent Receiver. Appearances were made by Everett G. Barry, Jr., Thomas C. Hebrank, Peter A. Davidson, William P. Tooke, Francis E. Quinlan, Jr., and Sam S. Puathasnanon, as noted in the Court's record.

27 | | | | | | |

28 | | | | | |

Advisory

THOMAS C. HEBRANK 1 Permanent Receiver 501 W. Broadway, Suite 800 San Diego, California 92101 Phone: (619) 400-4922 3 (619) 400-4923 Fax: E-Mail: thebrank@ethreeadvisors.com 4 5 6 7 UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 8 9 CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA WESTERN DIVISION - LOS ANGELES 10 11 SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE Case No. 11-08607-R-DTB 12 COMMISSION, 13 Plaintiff, FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT 14 OF FEES AND COSTS TO THOMAS V. C. HEBRANK, AS RECEIVER CHARLES P. COPELAND, 15 **COPELAND WEALTH** 16 MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL Date: March 18, 2013 ADVISORY CORPORATION, and Time: 10:00 a.m. COPELAND WEALTH 17 8, 2nd Floor Ctrm: MANAGEMENT, A REAL ESTATE Judge: Hon. Manuel L. Real 18 CORPORATION, 19 Defendants. 20 21 22 23 24 25 26 27 28 RECEIVER'S FEE APPLICATION #5

HEBCO.125.353362.1

Thomas C. Hebrank ("Receiver"), the Court-appointed permanent receiver for 1 Copeland Wealth Management, a Financial Advisory Corporation ("CWM"), 2 3 Copeland Wealth Management, a Real Estate Corporation ("Copeland Realty"), and their subsidiaries and affiliates (collectively, the "Receivership Entities"), hereby 4 5 submits his fourth interim application for approval and payment of fees and reimbursement of expenses. This application covers fees and costs incurred during the period October 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012 (the "Application Period"). 7 The Receiver has incurred \$86,485.50 in fees and \$2,039.48 in costs for this 8 Application Period. Detailed descriptions of the services rendered are contained in 9 Exhibit A attached hereto. Exhibit B is a chart reflecting the hours and fees billed to 10 11 each category of services on a monthly basis during the Application Period. 12 Exhibit C is a summary of the out-of-pocket costs. During the Application Period, the Receiver and his staff have spent 493.0 hours at an overall blended billing rate of 13 \$175 per hour. The Receiver has discounted all fees by ten percent (10%) from 14 regular hourly billing rates. The Receiver is requesting and seeking interim 15 approval and payment of 75% of the fees for the Application Period totaling 16 \$64,864.13, and costs totaling \$2,039.48. The 75% interim award amount is 17 18 consistent with the Court's ruling on the Receiver's Second, Third and Fourth Interim Fee Applications. 19 20 21 I. OVERVIEW 22 A detailed description of the history and status of the case is contained in the 23 Receiver's Report #5 and subsequent filings. The following is an overview of the Receivership case for the Application Period. 24

A. Copeland Realty Business Operations

Copeland Realty's business is essentially to manage the eight commercial properties owned by the various Copeland Real Estate Limited Partnerships. The

25

26

27

1 Receiver had earlier terminated the Copeland Realty employees and closed down

- 2 the administrative office; thus saving the Receivership Estate approximately
- 3 \$25,000 per month. The Receiver has taken over operations for the properties,
- 4 including managing the properties, responding to tenant needs, working on leasing,
- 5 receiving rents, paying operating expenses and property taxes, and monitoring
- 6 insurance. In addition, the Receiver engaged tax professionals to prepare tax returns

7 for all of the Receivership Entities. The Receiver had to assist the firm in obtaining

8 the necessary information, and to provide ongoing assistance.

B. Forensic Accounting Review

During the Application Period, the Receiver worked extensively to prepare two additional forensic accounting reports; the second focusing on the verification of investor/limited partner equity in the Receivership Entities, and the third summarizing financial activities involving Defendant Copeland. For the investor equity report, the Receiver investigated, verified and tied out each investor's equity position. Purchase and sales contracts, 1031 exchange statements, and other documents were obtained and reviewed to verify initial investor contributions for each real estate limited partnership. Distributions and annual tax allocation entries were reviewed. Investor summaries were prepared for each investor, sent out to the investors, and then discussed individually with most of them to resolve any discrepancies. This Report was issued on February 6, 2013.

For the Defendant Copeland financial activities report, all transactions involving Defendant were reviewed and analyzed to determine funds and other consideration they received from the Receivership Entities. Pooled investment and other investment account details were obtained and reviewed. Defendant equity positions, loans, and advances were analyzed, as were profits from sales of Receivership Entities. Fees, commissions and other income were reviewed and summarized. Payroll information has been and is being obtained and summarized.

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

The Receiver anticipates issuing this forensic report in the near future.

C. Asset Dispositions

On March 12, 2012, the Court authorized the Receiver to engage leasing agents, appraisers and brokers for the Copeland Realty Limited Partnerships. Based upon these valuations, the Receiver recommended different forms of disposition for the various Copeland Realty Limited Partnerships. The following summarizes actions taken for the Application Period to date:

- 1. Copeland Properties Nine ("CP9") The Court approved an abandonment by the Receiver of the property on November 29, 2012. The settlement agreement with the lender on the property included the turnover to the Receiver of \$46,913.27 in escrow funds held by the lender.
- 2. Copeland Properties Ten ("CP10") The Court approved a settlement with the lender on December 28, 2012 whereby the Receiver abandoned his interest in the property. The settlement agreement with the lender on the property allowed for the Receiver to retain \$225,000 held by the Receiver.
- 3. Copeland Properties Fifteen ("CP15") The Court approved an abandonment by the Receiver of this property on October 1, 2012.
- 4. Copeland Properties Eighteen ("CP18") The Court approved a sale of the property which closed on December 7, 2012 for \$8,550,000. The sale was complicated by the lender on the property, who was extremely uncooperative and forced several extensions on the closing date, as well as making demands for unreasonable lender reimbursements for undocumented expenses.
- 5. On November 9, 2012, the Court denied a Motion to Consolidate Receivership Entities and Pool Assets and Liabilities of Receivership Entities filed by the Receiver. Accordingly, the Receiver is in negotiations with legal counsel for the remaining Copeland Realty Limited Partnerships (Copeland Properties Two,
- 27 L.P./Copeland Properties 17, L.P. ("CP2/17"), Copeland Properties Five, L.P.
- 28 ("CP5"), Copeland Properties Seven, L.P. ("CP7"), and Copeland Properties

Sixteen, L.P. ("CP16") to abandon the Receiver's interest in these remaining 1 properties to the limited partners for each entity. 2 3 **Notes Receivable Recoveries** D. 4 5 The Receiver has additionally performed an analysis and review of all notes receivable for the Receivership Entities, including the tracing of payments and 6 receipts to the accounting and bank records, locating and reviewing notes receivable 7 documentation, and performing interest calculations. In conjunction with General 8 Counsel, the Receiver has made demand for payment and is attempting to collect on 9 all non-Receivership Entities notes receivables. Receiver's counsel is in the process 11 of filing lawsuits to collect on notes receivable which appear to be collectible To date, \$83,907.90 has been collected. 12 13 II. FEE APPLICATION 14 The Receiver has recorded its time in the following categories: 15 16 A. General Receivership Asset Investigation & Recovery В. 17 18 C. Reporting 19 Operations & Asset Sales D. Claims & Distributions Ε. 20 21 F. Legal Matters & Pending Litigation 22 23 Although some tasks cross multiple categories, effort is made to allocate time to the most appropriate category in each instance. 24 25 26 **General Receivership** Α. 27 This category contains time spent by the Receiver on (a) participating in meetings and conferences with the SEC and legal counsel, (b) general administrative 28

1 matters including reviewing mail, emails and other correspondence directed to the

2 Receivership Entities, (c) correspondence and communications with lenders,

3 vendors, and tenants, (d) general bank account administration, (e) maintaining and

4 updating the Receiver's website with case information and documents, (f) the

employment of professionals, (g) traveling to Court hearings, investor

6 communications and conducting an investor general meeting, and (h) administrative

time involving the issuance of reports and sending of investor correspondence.

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
T. Hebrank	Receiver	\$225.00	76.7	\$15,963.75
G. Rodriguez	Director	\$157.50	5.0	\$393.75
L. Ryan	Accountant	\$90.00	1.8	\$162.00
TOTAL			83.5	\$16,519.50
Avg. Hourly Rate		\$197.84		

B. Asset Investigation & Recovery

Services in this category include time spent during the Application Period on (a) review of entity financial statements and accountings, (b) forensic accounting work including the analysis of assets and liabilities, entity receivables and payables, equity investments, and related party transactions; (c) identifying and securing receivership estate assets; and (d) recovery of receivership assets, including notes receivable. As previously noted, the Receiver has worked extensively during the Application Period to prepare Forensic Accounting Report #2 dealing with the investors' equity positions and Forensic Accounting Report #3 focusing on the financial activities of the Defendants.

25 ///

5

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

26 //

27 //

28 //

1	
2	
3	
4	
5	

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
T. Hebrank	Receiver	\$225.00	28.1	\$6,322.50
S. Hoslett	Managing Director	\$180.00	127.0	\$22,860.00
L. Ryan	Accountant	\$90.00	52.1	\$4,689.00
TOTAL			207.2	\$33,871.50
Avg. Hourly Rate		\$163.47		

C. Reporting

7 8

This category contains time spent by the Receiver attending Court hearings and preparing receiver's reports.

9 10

11

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
T. Hebrank	Receiver	\$225.00	5.0	\$1,125.00
G. Rodriguez	Director	\$157.50	1.2	\$189.00
TOTAL			6.2	\$1,314.00
Avg. Hourly Rate		\$211.94		

1213

14

15

16

D. Operations & Asset Sales

171819

Time billed in this category relates to the Receiver's (a) management and oversight of the real estate properties; (b) performing all accounting functions of the Receivership Entities, including making deposits, paying expenses, recording entries in the accounting system, preparing financial reports, and reconciling bank accounts;

2021

(c) leasing and property management activity; and (d) marketing, sale or other disposition of receivership assets, including the properties associated with the

2223

Copeland Limited Partnerships.

24

25 //

2627

2728

/ / / / / / / / /

///

1
2
3
4
5

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
T. Hebrank	Receiver	\$225.00	66.7	\$15,007.50
G. Rodriguez	Director	\$157.50	44.2	\$6,961.50
L. Ryan	Accountant	\$90.00	47.1	\$4,239.00
TOTAL			158.0	\$26,208.00
Avg. Hourly Rate		\$165.87		

E. Claims and Distributions

Time billed in this category includes the Receiver's work on the proof of claim process for investors and creditors.

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
T. Hebrank	Receiver	\$225.00	3.3	\$742.50
TOTAL			3.3	\$742.50
Avg. Hourly Rate		\$225.00		

F. <u>Legal Matters & Pending Litigation</u>

Time billed in this category includes the Receiver's work on (a) issues relating to actions against the Receivership Entities pending at the time of the Receiver's appointment, (b) meetings with legal counsel; and (c) oppositions and filings related to the operation of the receivership.

Name	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
T. Hebrank	Receiver	\$225.00	34.8	\$7,830.00
TOTAL			34.8	\$7,830.00
Avg. Hourly Rate		\$225.00		

G. Costs

The Receiver requests that the Court approve \$2,039.48 in costs. A detailed listing of each expense is summarized in Exhibit C. The Receiver charges \$.15 per

page for copies and all other items are billed at actual cost. Any travel reflects coach airfare and reasonable accommodations billed at cost.

III. THE REQUESTED FEES ARE REASONABLE AND SHOULD BE ALLOWED

A. Efficient Staffing – Customary Rates

The Receiver believes his request is fair and reasonable and that the fees and costs incurred were necessary to the administration of the receivership estate. The Receiver's request for compensation is based on its customary billing rates charged in similar matters, discounted by ten percent (10%). The blended hourly rate for all services provided by the Receiver during the Application Period is \$175. The Receiver's billing rates are comparable or less than those charged in the community on similarly complex matters. Although the Receiver reviews his hourly rates and adjusts them annually on January 1 to reflect greater experience and expertise, additional costs of operation, and comparable rates in the marketplace for competitive receivership firms, no rate adjustment will be requested in this case for 2013.

B. Costs

The Receiver also requests Court approval of \$2,039.48 in costs. A summary of costs is included as Exhibit C. The Receiver charges \$.15 per page for copies and all other items are billed at actual cost.

24 | / / /

25 / / /

26 / / /

27 /

1 IV. CONCLUSION 2 The Receiver has worked diligently and efficiently in fulfilling his duties and 3 has provided valuable service in that regard. This Fee Application has been 4 5 provided to the SEC in accordance with the Commission's rules concerning the payment of receivers. 6 7 WHEREFORE, the Receiver requests an order: 8 9 Approving \$86,485.50 in fees and \$2,039.48 in costs incurred by the Receiver during the Application Period; and authorizing payment on an interim 10 11 basis of 75% of the fees totaling \$64,864.13 and \$2,039.48 in costs, for a total of \$66,903.61, from available receivership estate assets in Copeland Wealth 12 13 Management (Copeland Realty), Copeland Wealth Management (Copeland Financial) and/or the Copeland Fixed Income Funds; 14 Granting such other and further relief as is appropriate. 15 2. 16 17 18 Dated: February 6, 2013 19 20 By: /s/ THOMAS C. HEBRANK 21 Permanent Receiver 22 23 24 25 26 27 28

EXHIBIT "A"

SEC - Copeland October 2012

	Ŀ					8						Ö	
	ш												
Allocation	۵	80				9	2.7	60	13	1.8	9.6	7'0	9.0
Billing Category Allocation	U		6										
20	m				5.0								
	4	6.0		9.0	8.0	0			0 0			2.3	
	Total Fee	382.50	189.00	383.75	531.00	1,170.00	330,75	81.00	495.00	283.50	351.00	765,00	94,50
	_	225.00 \$	157.50 \$			225,00	\$ 05.750	\$ 00.08	225.00 \$	157.50 \$	\$0.00	225.00 \$	157.50 \$
	Per Hour	\$ 22	80 170	Ш	69	\$ 22	eə <u>[U</u>	ол 149	\$ 22	30	69	\$ 22	69
	Personnel	1,7 Hebrank T.	1.2 Rodriguez. G.	5.0 Rodriguez, G	5.9 Ryan, L.		2.1 Rodriguez, G.	0.9 Ryan, L	2.2 Hebrank T.	1.8 Rodriguez, G	3.9 Ryen, L.	3.4 Hebrank, T.	0.6 Roanguez G.
Ì	Hours	1,7	12	5.0	6.0	6.2	2.1	60	22	1.8	3.8	3.4	9.0
	Description of Services	Investigate CP16 Home Savings ACH, loan maturity, etc. Attempt to contact lender (8) Follow up on tax and other investor lasues. Misc correspondence (9)	Participated In hearing (1) Conferred with T. Hebrank re Court hearing and coordinated execution of CP 16 Seventh Amendment (2)	Travel to and from Los Angeles for Court hearing	Responded to investor inquiries (.6), Begin to prepared investor schedule defailing equity for Receivers Report (5.0). Corresponded with N. Cook re 2011 K-1 (.3),	Review and process mail. Deposit checks (.8). Receive and review Court Addres. Discuse lidewy. (.5) Proceed on CPT-5 bandonment. Discuss with Atty Stephens (.8) Review and discuss CPB abandonment issues with Atty Stephens (.8) Review and discuss CPB abandonment between CPT Review and idiscuss CPB abandonment with Atty Stephens (.7) Review dams processing issues (.6) Discuss and review CPT 8 buyer requestion states (.8) Discuss and review CPT 8 buyer requestion advanced of ATT Review and discuss investor guarantor issues (.8)	Corresponded with Atty Kovaliviker re CP 15 transition documents. Conferent with D. Rapp re velocue branchior items. Conseponded with L. Ayan re same. Reviewed materials held in storage for transition of the last met. ATJ Corresponded with T. Votals mad R. Pilsde re offer to seasume data on CP 5 (2) Corresponded with T. Hobrank and Atly Stephens re CP 18 due diligence excension. Conferred with T. Yould re same	Conferred with T. Hebrank re status of CP15 and receipts of utility charge back for CP9, Corresponded with G. Rodriguez and D. Rapp re context information, (7) Conferred with S. Hoslett re investor correspondence and report, (2).	Property sale issues (.5) Download orders for posting., Inquire as to CP16 sale order (.6) CP15 shall order (.6) CP15 shardomment process and issues (.7) (CP16 shalls and inquiries (.4).	Coordinated delivery of physical documents held by Receiver on CP 15 to Atty Kovelliviers and D. Rapp. Corresponded with both and T. Hebrank it a various details of the samen (1.5) Corresponded with T. Hebrank MY Stephens, T. Youldi (various) te CP 18 due úllience akannation and stempe. (3)	Reviewed and sorted mail. Recorded vertoor invoices for CP15 and brepared payment. Recorded cash deposits for Coptaind Really, CP5, CP10, CP10, CP15, CP17, CP10, CP15, CP17, CP10, CP16, CP17, CP10, CP16, CP17, CP10, CP16, CP17, CP10, CP16, CP17, CP10, CP18, CP17, CP17, CP19, CP18,	Review A/P rui and sign checks (6). Correspondence re: tax liems (4). Follow up on Advance Sleep absandomment (3). Contact Cr Copeland re: payroll (2). Post orders or wabsite (3). Contact CP fe index (2). Review and comme	Corresponded with T. Youstif, J. Nimmyer and Atty Stephens re details of CP 16 due ditigence extension. Conferred with same re Phase I report and researched is prior Phase I was available (3).
	Date	10/1/2012	10/1/2012	10/1/2012	10/1/2012	10/2/2012	10/2/2012	10/2/2012	10/3/2012	10/3/2012	10/3/2012	10/4/2012	10/4/2012

	03				0								
	80	e,		0.2	20		0.3		· ·		£1	22	
			1,50		#	60		80	0,	7.4		22	
0.5	20		0.5		20			-	4			ଟ୍	
45,00	697.50	252.00	922.00	31.50	1,012.50		47.25	\$ 612.00	89 832.50	5 1,332,00	\$ 267.75	225.00 \$ 1,170.00	
\$ 00'06 \$	\$ 225.00 \$	\$ 167.50	00'08	\$ 157.50 \$	\$ 225.00				\$ 22500	\$ 180.00	8 157.50	\$ 225.00	
0.5 Ryan, L.	3,1 Hebrank, T.	1 6 Roddguez, G.	5 8 Rvan L	0.2 Rodriguez, G.	4.5 Hebrank T.	8.6 Hoslett S	0.3 Rodriguez, G.	6.8 Ryan, L.	3.7 Habrank T.	7.4 Hosleft, S.	1.7 Rodriguez, G.	5.2. Hebrank. 7.	
	torne Savings on CP16 loan (.4) TIC with C. Copeland Updates on status of property sales (.5) Review case ww. CP9 updated motion (.2) Make deposits (.5) Misc pondence (.5)	Conferred with T Yousfire stalls of the DPA Tisting agreement and Cp 16 early renewal (2) Reviewed various correspondence from T Yousfi, J. Nimmer and Atty Stephers re CP due diligence extension (2) Reviewed extension amendment (1) Revised and updated property stalls report (4) Corresponded with C, Derillon to CP T Seventh Amendment (1) Revised gareament and corresponded with T. Hebrark re same (5) Reviewed CP 1 listing agreement and corresponded contingencies requested for removal and corresponded with T. Yousif, J. Nimmer and Atty Stephers (3)	Continued to work on Investor schedule detailing equity for Receiver's Report (5.7) Corresponded with H. Grimm re CP15 Insurance, (.1)	Reviewed correspondence from Any Stephens and T. Youalf re- extension agreement.	Inquire as to forensic payroll issues, Update on status. Discuss obtaining payroll information with Attys and SEC (1.1) Reviews and work obtaining payroll information with Attys and SEC (1.1) Reviews mall, make obsorbed (3) Work on CPT's delinquent hannari Issues, property transition (2) Discuss consolidation motion (8) T/Cs with investors (8)	Trace investor tax returns, cash deposits and transfers. Test ending equily balances on investor exhibits. Continue responding to investor equily balances on investor exhibits.			B)	Work on Fixed income investor equity schedules/exhibits. Testing of Fixed Income 1 and 3 schedules.	Corresponded with Atty Stephens, T. Yousif and L. Nimmer re status of for the sale. Discussed provisions froud editories centerherin and easistence provided to tuyer to obtain financial and guaranty details (1.1) Corresponded with T. Hetrorie not 20 He I still and red sale. Corresponded with T. Vouel re assure status of tenant lease extension regolations and corresponded with 10 cell brokers to listing strategy and limitie, (8)	Respond to inquiries on CP7 sale, provide documents. Updata on CP18 sales actus, Marketirg updates, revelw.CP76 fills/ing agreement. Information and stategy. Discuss lease and tenant (145) Conf call on forends balans- investors and Defendants. Review updated abredules. Thoughou yon bissues (14) Investor TVCs (3) CP2/17 PSA and update on confingences (5) Review Opeland entities re-equity inclusion (5) Provide CP5 requested documents (5).	Continued work and testing on Fixed income 2 investor equity schedules.
10/4/2012	10/5/2012	10/5/2012	10/5/2012	10/6/2012	10/8/2012	10/8/2012	10/8/2012	10/6/2012	10/9/2012	10/9/2012	10/9/2012	10/10/2012	40000040

		40		70				0.4	
7.1	o c		27	ő	ත ජ	1.4	4	8:0	0.7
	œ			2.0				0.4	
		80		70		1.0		1.5	
287.75	621 00	450.00	189.00	00000	37.121	540.00	220.50	720.00	110.25
157.50	00 98			225 00 \$	157.50 \$	225 00 \$	62.751	225.00	167.50
e)	, , ,	64	↔	us	G)	so.	109	sa	
1.7 Rodriguez, G.	S Rvan. L	2.0 Hebrank, T.	1.2 Rodriguez, G.	4.8 Hebrank T	0.9 Rodriguez, G.	24 Hebrank T.	Rodriguez, G.	3.2 Hebrank T.	2 Rodranes G
10	_	0							ımer 3
Corresponded with 7, Course and 2. Corresponded with R. Platrant resemble (3) Corresponded with 7, Habrant resemble (3) Corresponded with 8, Platrant resemble (3) Corresponded with 7, Habrant resemble (3) Confresponded with 7. Habrant resemble (3) Confresponded with 7. Habrant resemble (3) Conferred with 7 Yousif resemble of Platra and 1. Yousif (3) Conferred with 7 Yousif resemble (2) Platra and 1. Yousif (3) Conferred with 7 Yousif resemble (2) Platra and 1. Yousif resemble (2) Platra and 1. Yousif resemble (2) Purther corresponded with B. Fiskar e loan documents (3) Corresponded with the CP 18 Buyer resemble (2) Further corresponded with B. Fiskar e loan documents (3) Corresponded with L. Ryan re CPP loan balance and CP7 rent payment (2).	Corresponders With 7 Roditipuez re-77 freant payment and CP15 foar balance, Corresponded multiple sines with D. Rapp ne CP15 final rence payment (.8). Confinal with 1 behavior sub-restors schedule, updating for 2011 K1's, Confinate with 11 behavior the investor schedule, firming on next Theating and Coopeland forensis, work. (8.1).	17C with Atty Stephens re: CP18 lender (.4) Property sales activity (.9) Review Court filings (.3) Misc correspondence. Review and process mail (.5)	Reviewed revised PSA for CPTTZ (3) Corresponded with T. Yousiff, J. Sordowski, Ally Stephens and T. Horrant is as successful expension of Arty Stephens are evisions to PSA and reviewed correspondence from same to buyer and buyer's course! (4) Corresponded with T. Yousif and reviewed OP of Biding (2) Corresponded with T. Yousif and the Distance of CPS manketing (1).	Review and execute CPT lighting greenment (4) TIC with Ality Staphens Its creditors. Review credior information and file (1) investor TiOs (5) Make depositis (4) Pick up properly files and take to storage (1.3). Correspondence with C. Copeland rev payroll documents (3) Review aquily foreract information. TIOs re: same (17) Updates on Istings and sieles adultify (3).	Corresponded with T. Hebrank and D. Raymer re site access for an universal relies of the State o	17/Cs re, CP18 buyer extension demand with broker, G. Rodriquez, Atty Stephans, etc. Execute extension (1.4) Review case filings (.5) Review and process mail. mac. cats (.5).	Coordinated Phase i Environmental Report with Tenant and vendor, Corresponded with Profit to Coordinate units beginning events and protocols with learnt employees (4) Coordinated extension emeridment for CP-18. Conferred with T. Hebrank and Atty Stephens restrained. Covered emericated with T. Hebrank and Atty Stephens restrained. Covered emericated with Atty Stephens (1) Perticipated in a conference call re-evolving strategy. Coordinated for delivery of amendment with Atty Stephens (1)	Correspondence with QPB utilities ere shut-off (2) Raview court fings Download, scan and have posted to weballe. Corriscat attive re: same (1 5) CP10 update (2) CP15 collection lifemation and date (4) Discuss responses to oppositions with attorneys (4) Discuss investor equity stake and creditor issues (4)	Coordinated delivery of executed amendment to T. Yousif and J. Nimme. [Coordinated delivery of executed amendment to T. Yousif and D.P. 18 lease file Q.A. Cooresponded with T. Yousif and Atty Stephens re CP 1712-PSA.(2).
10/10/2012	10/10/2012	10/11/2012	10/11/2012	10/12/2012	10/12/2012	10/15/2012	10/15/2012	10/18/2012	10/16/2012

		0.5													80			
05 V	0 2	6.0	0.2	0.2	4,0	Č	9 0		0.21			0.2					6	
											1.8			02		16		2.0
		0.3			20			2.0		e	2				90			
432.00	ı	247.50	Т	18.00	517.50			1			1	31.50	153.00		\$ 495,00	\$ 288,00	\$ 204.75	\$ 180.00
0000		\$ 225.00 \$	1	\$ 00.08 \$	\$ 225.00 \$	\$ 157.50	00.08		157.50	235.00	180.00	\$ 157.50 \$	6000	00 08		180.00		8 90 00 8
88 Rvan		1.1 Hebrank T	Condition of	0.2 Ryan, L.	2.3 Hebrank, T.	Rodriguez, G.		r.	ø			0.2 Rodriguez, G.			Hebrank, T,	1.6 Hoslett. S	ø	2 0 Ryan, L.
Conferred with M. Cooper of Kentucky Utility to CP9 payment, discussed cooperative sizes and verified among due, Dipotated Anvance Desent Seep school states and verified among very deep. Ordered with T. Kovalikver ro. CP-15 leand than balance of account, Created spractule for Advance Sleep at CP-15 and forwarded to T. Hebrarik and T. Kovalikver Corresponded with D. Rapp to CP 15 insutance, varified insutance. Corresponded with D. Rapp to CP 15 insutance, varified insutance and CP16, propagated by the CP16 and CP17, CP9 CP17 and CP18 CP18 CP18 CP18 CP18 CP18 CP18 CP18	o discuss updates and strategy (5) CP9 transition		900		Review and sign AP checks (B), TIC with Investor (3) Review tax returns for CWM and Financial Advisory (5) Review tenant demand eletter and accompanying schedules (A) Misc legal correspondence (3)	nded with K. Hagaman, tenant at CP 5 re takedown of g broker sign Corresponded with T., Yousif and R., Pliaka re	multiple revisions to CP15 Advanced Desen Sleep schedule; I to T. Hobrank and T. Kovalivker.	Review and execute opposition reply motion (5) T/Cs with investors. Review and process mail (7) T/C with Alfy Barry re-legal markers. CP9 request. Review associated documents (3).	ith T., Yousif and J., Sorokowski re stalus of CP 17/2	Review oppositions and case filings. Discuss with attrys. Copy, scan and cost to website. Discuss, review and approve responses (2.2) Assist Investors that kix issues (5.) T/C with investor. Respond to CP10 questions (6.) Misc insurate information (2.)	Research and discussion with investors regarding equity issues: 1.8	1 the CP	In drowards of PRF (Bustance) Bellate In J. Glorina at Goodwin, and sorded mail. Recorded deposits for CP2, CP5, CP7 and aneat bank reconditions for CP2, CP4, CP5, CP7, CP9, and bank reconditions for CP2, CP4, CP5, CP7 and CP5, CP7, CP6, CP7 and CP7, CP8, CP7 and CP7, CP8, CP7, CP7, CP7, CP7, CP7, CP7, CP7, CP7	iry and remaining investor	positions and filings, TVCs with artnys re: tephens and review of CP18 lander payoff (4) teview and process mail. Misc	ched investors issues, discussions regarding equity schedules	Corresponded with T, Yousif re stellus updales on CP-17/2 PSA, and CP-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7-7	Researched and gathered information on investors, J., Meeder and U. Doan. Reviewed investor binder and creates schedule of all entities. 2.0
Confer peccour beched 10/16/2012 Kovalin Advan Corres theck theck	40/47/2040 MBt W		T	10/17/2012 same 1	Review 10/18/2012 returns letter a	10/18/2012 competing	10/18/2012 Prepar	10/19/2012 Review	10/19/2012 Correspo	Review and po 10/22/2012 Assist question	10/22/2012 Resea	10/22/2012 Correspond	Scenario (Review Cop. 10/22/2012 (CP10, CP10, CP	10/22/2012 Confe	10/23/2012 same RMSC	10/23/2012 Resear	Corre- 5, 7 ar 10/23/2012 slatus corres additional	10/23/2012 Reser

				133				G G				0.3			
o		2:0				7.0		90		0.1				90	
21	ou un		φ.	90	5,5		0.3		89		10		7.3		2,0
e,				8,0				ψŋ				0.3			
1.080.00	1 D44 D0	110.25	135.00	607 50	72.00	110.25	27.00	675.00	1,134.00	15.75	459.00	135.00	1,314,00	94.50	00'089
225.00	180.00	69	00 08	225,00 \$	180.00 \$	157.50 \$	90.00	225.00	(s)		\$0.00	225.00 \$	180.00	157.50	\$ 00.08
691	10			69	s	vs.	ю	un	s)	2	uq	**	69	w	
4.8 Hebrank, T.	5.8 Hoslett S.	0.7 Rodriguez, G.	1.5 Ryan, L.	2.7 Hebrank, T.	0.4 Hoslett S.	0.7 Rodriguez, G.	0.3 Ryan, L.	3.0 Hebrank T.	6.3 Hosleft S.	0.1 Rodriguez, G.	S.1 Ryan, L	0.6 Hebrank, T.	7.3 Hoslett. S.	0.6 Rodriguez, G.	7.0 Ryan, L
sales activity and sisting avairation (.5) Review payroll up on Operland forentis work (.9) Conf Call on tax alaus, circektist of O'S issues. Arrange follow-up migs snoce nr. Atty Tornes CP9 guarantee issues, Diecuss ance nr. Atty Tornes CP9 guarantee issues, Diecuss call with SEC (.7) Review and discuss CP2/17 explanant (.4) T/Cs with attrys on legal issues (.4)	-	m. T. Hebrank to sproperly updates including CP 17/2 judated properly schedule accordingly (4) T. Hebrank re CP 17/2 listing agreement and T. The trains of the CP 17/2 listing agreement and the CP 17/2 listing	r questions, Copeland rms on Copeland for attorneys re rk and S. Hoslett re list S. Jablow re additional	loan guarantees. Follow-up (7) T/Cs with attrys (5) Review and process mail, misc, Review equity forenals work and issues (8)	sland agreements and corresponded with L. Ryan.	Conferred with T, Yousti re status of CP 18 sale, (2) Conferred with Atry Stephens re same and corresponded with Atry Chorine re further information re Garden Ridge Investments with (3) Reviewed lease quarterly and intendrient (2).	Researched agreements and corresponded with S. Hoslett re same,		and's benefit from repare Copeland dule and schedule	one re CP 18 guaranty (1)	Worked with S. Hoslett on reviewing and analyzing Copeland's benefit from LPs, Fixed Incomes and Copeland Westin, Begun to prepare intranspersent les schedule and schedule to Copeland's acutivin LP's.	s (.3) Misc correspondence (.3)	ø	Corresponded with Atty Ciplone re CP 16 guaranty (2). Corresponded (ventual) with T, Yousfi re stalus update on CP 18 sale(2). Corresponded with T. Yousfi re status update on CP 16 early lease renewe (2).	o work on Copeland management fee and Copeland equity Revewed Copeland Balance Sheet and reviewed activity in Paccounts for unusual wite-offs, Prepared list of outstanding poland forensic project.
10/24/2012 (10/24/2012	10/24/2012	10/24/2012	10/25/2012	10/25/2012	10/25/2012	10/25/2012	10/26/2012	10/28/2012	10/28/2012	10/26/2012	10/29/2012	10/29/2012	10/29/2012	10/28/2012

1.2				0			Y	14.5			\$ 3,262.50			\$ 3.262.60
								00				¥		
5.1		80	7	20		0	го С	52.1			\$ 3,845.00 \$	\$ 0000000	8 1305.00 8	\$ 8,320.50 \$
						÷		12)				* 00.00*	_	189.00
	2.8		8	42	6.7		4.0	106.7			\$ 2,610,00 \$	9,144,00	3 007 500 8	15,741.00
6.0			, n	6,0				37.1			\$ 6.817.50 \$	\$	162.00 s	7,373,25 \$ 15,741.00
675 00			207.00	1.440.00	1,206,00	915.00	387.00	\$ 34,886.26		\$ 35,700.27	\$ 16,335,00 \$	\$ 9,144,00 8	8 5,855,25 a	10.1
225,00	180.00		9000	225.00 \$	180.00 \$	57.50	00 06		0,0,	40		_	00.00	-
20	Na E	69	**	8	89	o)	சு				49		,,	
3.0 Hebrank, T.	2.8 Hoslett S.	0.9 Rodinguez, G.	2.3 Rvan L	6.4 Hebrank T.	6.7 Hoslett, S.	2.0 Rodriguez. G.	4.3 Ryan L				Hebrank, T.		Ryan Syan	Toyalla an
3.0	2.8	60	2 8	4.0	6.7	20	6.3	211.6			72.6	50.8	80.6	211.8
Confroit, discussions with Atly Barry and review documents re. Flagster (1.2) CP9 tender Information (.2) Review and process mail, miss correspondence (.5) Sales activity and updates, execute extension on CP18 (1.1).	Discussion with L. Ryan regarding Copeland issues, Review and research Peterson equity issues.	Corresponded with J. Mirrner and T. Yousfi re status of CP 16 Gustanny (2) Corresponded with J. Mirrner 17. Yousfi and Alty Staphers re status update on CP 19 sale (4) Corresponded with T. Hebrank re extension of due diligence period and recommendation, coordinated same with Alty (Stephens (2))	Conferred multiple times with S. Hoslett ne various Copeland questions. Researched equity, buyout from Pearcent in Copeland Westh and corresponded with S. Hoslett ne same. (6) Connesponded with S. Jablow te lax returns. (3) Powarded DrO cash balance of I pleand Advisory bare cuthins. (3) Powarded DrO cash balance of I pleand. Prepared management fee payments for CPS, CP7, CP10, CP10 CP10, CP11, CP10 and CP19, CP10,	Prepared for and met with project team and attorneys on Forensic Reports 2 and 3. Follow up (4.2) Review invoices, sign and distribute AP Checker, wilex deposits (3) Sales activity update (.5) Prepare for court hearing. Discuss status with attorneys (.5)	Prepare for and meet with T. Hebrank regarding Copeland forenalc report issues. Prepare for and attend meeting with Counsel and T. Hebrank regarding report details and consolidation issues.	Corresponded with T. Youalf ne CP 1172 listing agreement and provided beseuke to opy (2). Corresponded with "Xyanr be blances due on CP morigages (various) and provided details to Atty Stephens re feat application (3). Corresponded with T. Yousif and J. Nimmer (various) re application (2). Corresponded with T. Yousif and J. Nimmer (various) re Updies an CP 18 extension (3). Reviewad correspondere from Atty Stephens re CP 18 extension amendment. Reviewed starte documents and corresponded with T. Hebrank re execution of seme. (1)	Met with S. Hostert and T. Hebrank to discuss Copeland foremaic report, Copelands benefit and outstanding learns on investor report. Met with E. Barny. J. Stephens, T. Hebrank and S. Hostelt to discuss details of investor report and consolidation of entities. (4) Gathered loan palance information and forwarded to G. Rodriguez (3).							
10/30/2012	10/30/2012	10/30/2012	10/30/2012	10/31/2012	10/31/2012	10/31/2012	10/31/2012	SubTotal Fees		Grand Total				

SEC - Copeland November 2012

7	и									I	T								
	_		L			60					-	1							
	ш					0													
Billing Category Allocation	۵	-		0.7	12		80	0.5	0.2	0.2				0.4				12	
ng catego	o										20								
٥	0	0	1,6			7.0							137 167		91 10	13	99		
	<	2				0.4						5.5				60 60			
	Total Fee	810.00	288,00	110.26	108.00	450.00	125.00		31.50	31.50	262.50	618.75	00 056	63 00	531.00	05 200	\$ 224.00	189.00	
	Per Hour T	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00 \$	\$ 157 50 \$	90.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 157.50 \$	\$ 00.06 \$	\$ 157.50 \$	\$ 157.50 \$	\$ 225.00 \$	11250 \$	\$ 180,00 \$	\$ 157.50 \$	\$ 30.00 \$	\$ 225.00	\$ 00.081	\$ 157.50	
	Personnel	3.6. Hebrank T.		Rodriguez G		2 0 Hebrank T.	0.8 Rodriguez G.	yan, L	0.2 Rodriguez, G.	locinguez, G.	2.5 Hebrank, T.	S.S. Hebrank, T.	5.9 Hoslett S.	0.4 Rodriguez G	yan, L	4.1 Hebrank T.	6.8 Hosiett, S.	1.2 Rodriguez G	1 1 1 1 1 1
ŀ	Hours	88	1.6 H	0.7 R	12 Rysn	201	80	0.5 Ryan,	0.2 8	028	25	200	5.9 F	0.4	5.9 Ryan,	4.1	80	12 8	
	Description of Services	Review and process mail. Miss correspondence (7) Review CP18 sales cocs (4) CP9 property issues T/Cs with tenent and property immager (5) Request records for private aculty investments (5) Assist with forentier privates, review related documents (1)	Review Private Equity Quickbook Files for equity issues.	Corresponded with B, Plisse re CP 5 status update (2). Corresponded with Atly Stephens, T. Youstif and J. Nimmer re status update on the sale of CP 18. Reviewed fully executed emendment (5).	Conferred with S. Hosielt re investor meeting; summarized meeting with altorney's re status of investor report. Received and worked to download and appen Private Equity files; corresponded with Tielstrank re same Sent Copeland expense information in T. Hebrank, Created CPB operating stalement eard rent and sent to T. Hebrank, Created CPB	Review forensic information and report status (7). Review proof of cleim status and process to be followed (.9). Misc correspondence (.4).	Reviewed recommendation from P. Colvin and T. Yousif re CP 15 marketing and offer reselved. Cookins ab with "Yousif re property undestein or CP 16. Reviewed stratecy for seme (.8).	Completed restoring Private Equity QuickBooks files. Recorded CP17	Corresponded with B. Plisks re CP 5 property signage (.2)	Corresponded with K. Haguman re CP 5 property signage. (2)	Propare for and attend Court hearing. Discuss results with attnys.	Travel tofform LA for hearing.	Continued review of Private Equity accounts. Work with L. Ryan regarding equity issues in LPs and related schedules.	Conferred with B. Pilska re CP 5 property signage and leasing strategy	Reviewed accounting activity in Private Equity I and II QuickBooks. Worked with S. Hoslett and begun to trace Copeland equity received in LP's.	Make deposits Misc correspondence (7) Corf call with fotensic team Follow up (13) investor correspondence, discuss same with SEC (.6) Review and process mail, sign AVP checks. Make deposits (1.3)	Discussion with L. Ryan and T. Hebrank re: investor report issues Work on schedule of mestors that were cashed out of Linited Partnerships. Work on forensic engagement loss analysis and surmany of uses on funds.	Conferred with T. Hebrenk re court neering update (2). Updated properly stalus report, (3). Corresponded with K. Hegaman end B. Pliska re C. S. sigmage and photos (3). Corresponded with C. DeFilippor as onignal arrangement (2).	Forwarder factured to PS reports to M. Hells Continent with S. Hollself reputed to September Houset and T. Helatet with the September heavit recornicitations for Copaland Realty, Fixed Incomes I. II. I and Financial Andreas Recording deposits to Copaland Realty, Fixed Income I. Fixed Income II. Pixed Income II. CRG. CPT and CPTO Reviewed and saried
	Date	11/1/2012	11/1/2012	11/1/2012 "	11/1/2012	11/2/2012	11/2/2012	11/2/2012	11/3/2012	П	T	11/5/2012	11/5/2012	11/5/2012	11/5/2012	11/6/2012	11/6/2012	11/6/2012	11/6/2012

80				, c	2			2.5
								101
0		0.2	10	0	,	2	2.4	
O 6	10			÷	u u			
				C	2			0.6
1.485.00	1.098.00	31.50	549.00	P. RGD				900.00
\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 157.50 \$	SI 00.00	8 2 5	180 00		\$ 00 06 \$	\$ 225.00
6.6 Hebrank T.	6.1 Hoslett S.	0.2 Rodriguez, G.	van L	A State on The Control of the Contro	S Hoslett S	2 B. Radinalez. G.	J. wav. L.	40 Hebrank T.
88	H 18	0.2 Rr	6 1 Ryan.	4	T w	60	2.4 Ryan.	40 H
Review L. Pelance shreets and amounts owed puffrom parties (1.2). Prepared for and mate With airtys on case strategy and stops going (movard (1.5) update on sales activity and status of pending sales (5). Review furestor cash cuts, (6) Licidae on NIX collection (sause (.5). Review furestoristic date no. Defendants (.7) Review legal entity and related secure due to non-consolidated. Discuss with airtys (1.2).	Finalize schedule of Investors that were cashed out and forward to T Hebrank. Incorporate A/R schedules into equify analysis, Research Private Equify issues related to A/R and A/P Discussions with L. Ryan ies. Antous issues.	Received copy of CP 17/2 listing renewal and reviewed same (.2)	Prepared scheduler of permify investions with Accounts Receivable of behaltmens as Flowed incomes or Copeland Virealit, forwarded sense to T Hebrane Provided vegualisted cash belances to T Hebranek, Continued to work with S Healite to essent or and trace Copeland equity in LPs. Researched park statements and disting statements for sources of cash front Copeland. Reviewed and provided statements of loan activity long S Bricker.	Follow up on CP10 property menager information, Arranga for conference acill. Discuss properly access for lender, investors (9) Prepare for SEC (15) Review CP1-81 Properly of SEC (15) Review CP1-81 Provided and accounts payable information. Review enter file for CP19 per-recoverible invoices. Provide to althysic (12) Search for CP19 per-recoverible invoices, provide to althysic (12) Search for CP2 documents per ARy Tores demand elser. Provide to althroyel (12) Search for CP3 documents per ARy Tores demands elser. Provide to althroyel (13) Search for CP3 documents per ARY Tores Request documents for each strategy and documents needed. Request documents for each strategy accessed (7) Review alequity buyous (4) CP19 closing sease, extension of closing date (4)	Prepare for and hold conference call re: Forensic report. Prepare schedulas of financial analysis for conference call	Reviewed correspondence from B. Pfiska re Faurecia Automotive property. Conspondent a salatu automet (2). Conspondent versional with 1 Minmes and T. Yousif re origing status of CP4 sale including negotiations with Inschi, CB Reviewed versions exceed and (18) exceeding discussions of the conspondent status of the constitution	Prepared end send CP16 vendor list to T Hebrank revised and resent Researched Accounts Receivable calleolad; prepared calleolido summary and forwarded LO Hebrank Repared CP3 Accounts Beyable summary and forwarded for T Hebrank Corresponded with a Selbeahry to GP10 finite Researched in resetts establed out and any transfer of introces, corresponded with S. Holeit is sentie.	Investor calls and correspondence (.5) Prepare for, mak with attrys and hold corri call with Akiy Quinlan. Follow up with project ream, broker Discuss with SEC (2.5) Review creditor and proof of claim process and stirgs (1.0).
11,77,2012		11/7/2012	11/7/2012	11/8/2012	11/8/2012	11/8/2012	11/8/2012	11/9/2012

2.0	0°	4		0.7	90	52	0.4	96.		2.4
		0	3.3						6.2	
315.00	117.00	642 50 4 7	594.00	110.25	02 79	270.00	84.50	6.0.002987	336.00	376.00
60 US 1 CS 1		\$ 225.00 \$ 1,642.50	\$ 180.00 \$	\$ 157,50 \$	90.06	8 225.00 \$	\$ 157.50 \$	\$ 225.00 \$ 1,396.00	\$ 180.00 \$	\$3 757.55
2.0 Rodríguez. G.	† 3 Ryan, L.	2.3 Hebrank, T.	3.3 Hoslett S.	0.7 Rodriguez, G.	0.6 Ryan. L	1.2 Habrank T.	.06 Rodriguez, G	62 Habrank T.	52 Hosiett S	24 Rodriguez G
Conferred with Thebrahr is stalled projects and conferred with TY Cougli re same (£). Reviewed LOI for CP 16 (3) Conferred with T. Hebrank re of Pt 8 earlier meant (£). Hebrank re of Pt 8 escord memorithent, trow wed same document (£). Reviewed correspondence from Atty Madione re titledescrow closing documents and information. (2) Conferred and corresponded with MI Burnatt e passet from Pt 8. Corresponded with MI Replants re same matter (5) Reviewed 10 for CP6 (2). Reviewed 10 for CP6 (2). Reviewed 10 for CP6 (2).	Recording Accounts Receivable report with loan payments received to date. Recorded deposits for Copeland Really, CP2, CP16, CP17 and CP18 Recorded vendor involces and prepared payments for CP16 and CP17.	Prepare budget for case non-cansoldated. Review receivables and payables between entitles. Fedulate read-restrict season on non-consolidate basis (3.7). Conf. Cell rec. CP10. Review issues with Atty Brang (4.9). Discuss cerals natities and related issues with atty service are summary of inter-entity payables and receivables (1.4). Investor pairs and correspondence (1.0). Discuss timing of favoratic reports (.4).	Call with L. Ryan re various equity issues. Reseach open issues remaining in analysis.	Dorferrad with T. Yousit re status of the OPS sale (3) Reviewed vericus correspondence regarding OPT is associd emerdramst and provided copies of the serine, (2) Corresponded with T. Hebrank and Atrys Stephens and Barry re négotiations with recursed lender (2).	Forwarcad multiple cash balances to T. Hetrenk. Conferred with T. Hebrank and S. Hoseld, re Investor report. Conferred with T. Hebrank re- 10th foot payables Prepared and forwarded schedule of menagement fless collected during Recedentship.	Trics with Attys Barry and Stephens on CP18 CP10 and other sele- closing and logal issues. Follow up on needed information. Execute the property and property (1.2).	Revisived correspondence from Atty Stephens re Thrd Amendment to Contract. Reviewed same (.3) Corresponded with T. Hebrank re CP 18 lender (.1) Corresponded with T. Yousif re sele of CP 18 Third Amendment (.2).	TVC with Alty Berry on CP10, other issues. Follow up re: seme (8) Reveree and comment, on CP10 settlement agreement (1 Request, and Obtain L. Pinencial information re abendomment issues (1 S) Review CP10 creditor shuarton (1.7) Review and process mile. Make desposits Miles correspondence (8) Conf teal liwft This Company, Alty Staphens on CP18 closing issues. Follow up calls and actions on closing issues (1 5) Multiple calls with Alty Berry on legal issues (5)	Research Investor address for T. Hebrank verify CP 16 equity issues for Euredoher investors. Work on final investor equity schedules for Exact Income partnerships.	Conferred with T Yousis and AIV Sephenies reside of CPP 18 and ender negotiators (5) Corresponded with B Boiles re tille exceptions to CPP 18 also and researched documents evaliable. Corresponded with T Hebranck researched conjuent of commants to B Cellas to celar little exceptions (1.4). Corresponded with M. Burnett re copies of property and water lien. Reviewed Culticot County website and provided oppes of links to M. Burnett (4). Reviewed copy of CP18 Third Americines (1.).
11/9/2012	11/9/2012	11/12/2012	11/12/2012	11/12/2012	11/12/2012	11/13/2012	11/13/2012	11/14/2012	11/14/2012	11/14/2012

	9											0	
	6		0.7	g G		0.2	82	2.1		0.7	1.3		
						Q							
	0	69		Ω Ο	aŭ e			13	7.8				6.7
				5				21				03	
\$ 297.00		\$ 1242.00	\$ 110.25	s 1012.50	\$ 1,512,00	\$ 31.50	\$ 27.00	\$ 1.237.50	\$ 1,404.00	\$ 110.25	\$ 117.00	\$ 292.50	180.00 \$ 1,206.00
00 06 8	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 167.50	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 90.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 90,00	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00
⊐ wan	4.8 Habrank T.	6.9 Hoslett S	0.7 Rodriguez, G	4.5 Hebrank, T.	8.4 Hoslett S.	0.2 Rodriguez, G	0.3 Ryan. L	55 Hebrank T.	7.8 Hoslen, S.	0.7 Rodriguez G.	1,3 Ryan, L.	13 Habrank T.	6.7 Hostell, S.
3.3 Ryen	40	60	8.20	24	9.8	026	0.3 R		7.8	0.7	13	13	6.7
Hydracity is CP10, unsation quantities, CP17 meragement fee and CP18 (lear payables, Researched CP18 mined for I. Herbrick, Pergrad CP17 management fee payment, Provided CP17 management les payment, Provided CP10 cash believes and quity, balance for T Hebrark, Conferred with S Hostelt re multiple questions and learns to be researched. Propared and sent CP10 Accounts Payable individualisation to T. Hebrark.	Correspondence and calle to CP16 closing issues. Calls with lender's course, laritys. Obbar And financial Information. (1) Obtain and to even the Principle and inter-entity data. Evaluate for recoivership going floward (1) Review flarages agreement. Discuss with Atty Faiss Contact purchaser (1) Review equily forevisit report data and assumptions (8) Misc updates with attrys (4).	Work on Equity Report exhibits for Copeland Limited Parmenships [5,6,7,8] including linking schedules, verifying amounts and formating exhibits.	Reviewed correspondence from Atty Stephens te status of negoliatione with the secured lender (1). Corresponded with T. Habrank re status of the CP 5 trainine. Conferred with B. Bolles re additional information to diear earow acceptions. (5)	Cort call with CP18 lenders and Attys on CP18 dosing issues, Followup, Northy parties as to closing sistues, (177 Assist; with lax issues (2,8 Review daline) bar process and filings. Discuss With Atty Barry, (8) Review and cliacuse sequity report with S. Hasteit and Atty Barry, (8) Post filing to website (4) Review and process mail (2)	Work on Equity Report exhibits for Copeland Limited Pertnerships (9, 10, 17, 8, 16, 17 & 18) including linking schedules, verifying amounts and formating exhibits.	Corresponded with B. Boiles (eacrow agent) re staus of secured lender regatistions and remaining escrow closing executions (2)	Corresponded with T Hebrank re Financial Advisors QuickBooks file Conferred with S. Hodelt re investor schoolule and status of sarrie.	Review, scan and have case filings posted on website (1.4) CP18 saies issues. Obbuss with CR doctougues and ARM Stelbrane (9) CP9 properly report issues (5) Review equity report exhibits and discuss issuance of separt (1.0 CP9 disposition resus with thanks (4.5 Assist J. Alvarez which tax issues (4.1) Investor correspondence (3) Review cashed out investor schedule, discuss (3) CP10 property updete (2)	Finalize equity investment schedules, proof all schedules, forward Limited Partnership schedules to T. Hebrank.	Corresponded with Alty Stephers as oPP18 HQA, (1) Corresponded with Atty Stephers and T. Hebrank re potential Fourth Amendment to Contract (2) Corresponded am conferred with M. Burnett is passed as proparty taxes for CP Φ (3) Conferred with T. Yousti re status update fibe state of CP 16(2).	Forwarded CP9 book balance to T. Hebrank. Recorded vendor Invoices and pregared payments for CP9 and CP16. Prepared benink reconciliations for CP5, CP9, CP16 and F12. Recorded deposits for CP2, CP6, CP10 Reward and sorted mail; filed senne.	Multiple discussions and correspondence with attnys on various legal issues (1.0). Misc correspondence (.3).	Finalize Fixed Income and remaining Limited Partnership equity exhibits, proof all schedules, forward to T. Hebrank.
11/14/2012	11/15/2012	11/15/2012	11/15/2012	11/16/2012	11/16/2012	11/16/2012	11/16/2012	11/19/2012	11/19/2012	11/19/2012	11/19/2012	11/20/2012	11/20/2012

				233				1.1								
100	0	90	6.0	80		0 4		12	800			0.5		4 1		9
	0.0															
					*0		12			95	0.5		0.7	1.0	4.9	
	60			Ö				90		4.4				0.8		
\$ 157.50	05 208	98 00	00.98	720.00	270.00	\$ 63.00	3 108.00	\$ 652.50	126.00	\$ 675.00	00.06	\$ 7875	63.00	69	\$ 882.00	ry CA
\$ 157.50	\$ 225 00	157.50	8 90.00	225 00	\$ 180.00		00'06 \$	\$ 225.00	\$ 157.50	\$ 225.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 157 50	00.00	225.00	\$ 180.00	7. 7.7 6.4
1.0 Rodriguez G.	2.7 Hebrank T.	g	0,4 Ryan, L	3.2 Hebrank T.		0.4 Rodriguez, G.	1,2 Rysn, L	2.9 Hebrank, T.	0 8 Rodriguez, G	3.0 Hebrank T	0.5 Hosiell S.	0.5 Rodriguez, G	0.7 Ryan L	3.2 Hebrank, T.	4.9 Hoglett, S.	C reacions
0,1	27.2				1.5.1	0,4	1.2 F			30	90		20	32	6.8	Ş
Bolles (escrou) is property as payment and payment of water lien for property (2). Derresponded with Litheran and Ally, Suphrens referred of EPR Security Amendment. Reviewed same and provided commentine as aem e.g. Domesconded with Alty Stephens re various agent early and accomment of the secure distinct on series.	Review and process mail, Meke deposits, review and sign APF checks [9] Sale of obstiging issues. Review and electual CPT Sale exements (?) Update on dispositions of assets (.4) CP2/17 property issues (.2) blicause issues and responses rei upcoming Court hearing (.5).	Reviewed Fourth Amendment to contract and correspondence from T, Hebrank and Atty, Stephens re same (.2). Corresponded with J, Nimmer and T. Yousif (vericus) as terms of Fourth Amendment (.2).	Researched CP16 Insurance payments. Corresponded with H. Grimm at Goodwin re same.	Mutiple T/Cs with Atty Barry on legal issues (1.0) Review and exacute reply motions and declarations (.5) Review Court filings and oppositions (.7) Review and process mail (.3) CP18 closing issues (.5)	Prepared equity schedules for Private Equity One and Private Equity Two.	Carresponded with T Yousif and J. Nimmer re status of the Fourth Amendment (1) Corresponded with Atty. Stephens re Fourth Andordment to agreement (1) Corresponded with T., Hebrank re Incures from Figelity. Tille re QP (8 sale (2)).	Prepared equity schedules for Private Equity One and Private Equity Two.	Review and discuss with attrys issues relating to CP10 seltlement agreement. Review related documents (1,1) Review and discuss CP18 closing issues (1,2) Review and process melt, Misc correspondence (8).	Corresponded with T. Hebrank re title company. Conferred re seme and reviewed estimated dosing statement and convence estimated dosing statement and corresponded with Alby. Statebens re series (3.3 Corresponded with T. Yousif and J. Nimmer re closing documents (2).	Review and print out CP10 related fillings. Post to website (8) T/Cs with Atty Stephens and Bany to CP18 design tissues. Review related correspondence, (11) Assist with text states, request documents (5) Discuss equity report and signedules (5).	Review Copeland Wealth schedule of payable and receivable balances for inclusion in investor report.	Corresponded with J. Nirmer re status update from title re CP 18 lobaing (1) Corresponded with Alth Stephenr re settimated closers statement for CP 18 (1) Forwarded copy of estimated actions assistant for Trotals and J. Mirmer (1) Corresponded with Alth Stephens re IDS four. Researched sums (2).	Prepared Copeland Wealth schedule of payable and receivable balences to be included with investor report; forwarded same to S. Hosleit for review.	CP16 closing issues, discussions with aithys. Review related documents (1.4) Follow up on Financial Advisory status (.3) Review equally foremed schedules (1.0) Investor cells (.5).	Draft Forensic Report #2, review issues with L. Ryan	Corresponded with J Mimmer re status of renewed lease from CPT 5 terral of 1,1 Reviewad correspondante from Milys Madedra and Stephens re secured lender negotiations (2) Reviewad Fifth Americans to CP 18 sale and reviewed correspondence re seme (1) Correspondence the My Stephens re Owner's Affidant and various
11/20/2012 1	11/21/2012	11/21/2012	11/21/2012	11/26/2012	11/26/2012	11/26/2012	11/26/2012	11/27/2012	11/27/2012	11/28/2012	11/28/2012	11/28/2012	11/28/2012	11/29/2012	11/29/2012	11/29/2012

11/29/2012	Reviewed Forensia Report #2 and conferred with S. Hosielt to same. Researched CP18 tenent payment and corresponded with G. Rodriguez re-same Papeared payments for CP2, CP5, CP7, CP10, CP10, CP10, CP10, CP10, CP10, CP10,	-	Z S	- in	00'06	163.00					17		_	
11/30/2012	Handle CP2/17 propenty maintenance Issues (-4). Investor calla. Review and process mail (-8). CP9 repair issues (-3). CP18 closing issues, discussions with counsel (-9).	2.6	2.4 Hebrank T.	69	225 00 \$	1307	80				6			
11/30/2012	Conferred with T. Yousil re status of the CP18 sale and corresponded re same (.2). Reviewed correspondence from Atty. Stephens re various closing documents. Reviewed same (.3).		0.5 Rocriguez, G.	40)	157.50 \$	\$ 7875					80			
SubTotal Fees		202.0		+		\$ 36,614.25	28.4	106		3.0	68.7	2	2.8	13.0
						\$ 739.40				L			L	
						2								
										ŀ				
Grand Total						\$ 37,353.65				7			Н	
	Parent	34.9	Hebrank, T.	49	225.00	\$ 18,483.75	\$ 532125 8	\$ 2,610,00	\$ 675.00	**	6.322.50 \$	230 00	109	2 925.00
		70.7	Hostett, S.	67	180.00	180.00 \$ 12,728.00		\$ 12,728.00	100	-55			S	
		18.2	Rodriguez, G.	s	157.50	157.50 \$ 2,886.50					2,856.50 \$		1/3	
		282	Ryan, L.	so:	\$0.00	\$ 2,538,00	49	\$ 702.00	· w	67	1,636.00 \$		L	
		202.0				\$ 36,614.25 \$	\$ 5,321.25	5,321.25 \$ 16,038.00	60	8	675.00 \$ 11.025.00 \$	630.00	S	2 925.00

SEC - Copeland December 2012

									Silling Salesy	DITTILIS CAREGOLY ALLOCATION		
Date	Description of Services	Hours	Personnel	Per Hour		Total Fee	4	0	υ	0	Ш	ш
12/3/2012	Review and sign A/P checks. Review and process mail, Make deposits [1.0]. Update on CP18 sale issues (.S). Review and approve response to CP10 motion (.4).	2 3	2.3 Hebrank T.	22	89	1 1	0			or C		0
12/3/2012	Corresponded with T. Yousif re status update on sale of CP18 (1)	0.1	0.1 Rodnguez, G	ı	157.50 \$	15.75				0.0		
12/4/2012	TICS and correspondence with allinys on CP18 closing (sques (1.3) Review (2P1 Oppositions, scar and have perset of preside (8) above the abundenment exame decrease with Art Bann (6)	3.0	3 D Hebrank T	66	225.00	00 529	ď			:		o c
12/4/2012	Corresponded with T. Yousif re status update on sale of CP18 (.1)	0.1	0.1 Rodriguez, G		157.50 \$	15.76	3			0.1		0
12/5/2012	Investor calls (4) TiOs with attrys on CP16 cosing issues. Mat with Ally Stevens. Review and execute ocaling esprow documents (14). Review Cp2/17 abandorment documents and related issues (1.0). Make decosits: 5).	60	3.3 Habrank T	69	225 00 \$	742.50	0			2.0		
12/5/2012	Reviewed various correspondence iron Ally Stephens and T. Youali re OP 18 sais () Reviewed topy of larrier far agreement () Reviewed topy of larrier far agreement () Reviewed topy of lowers & Afficavit () Reviewed Intel obserg occurrents is easile of OP 18 can docrresponded with T. Hebrank to same (5) Reviewed Azoutaliere of Lesse autonoment ().	4	14 Rodriguez G.		167 50	220 50				-		
12/6/2012	Met with Alty Barry on various legal issues. TrC with SEC on investor issue (2.0) Met with Alty Stephens on CP18 sale documents and issues (4.4) Property management issues for CP9 and CP 2/17 (7.7) Investor calls and compensations (5).	3.6	3.6 Hebrank T.	89		810.00	0.5			:		2.0
12/6/2012	Reviewed Skith Americant to CP 18 sale (2) Corresponded and conferend with T Yousf for status of sale and provided copy of Skith Americant (4) Reviewed various correspondence from T, Hebbank and Ally Stethens or Coloning of sales, investigations of coloning or sales in eventually according to company and timely coloning course and timely coloning.	2.1	2 1 Rodriguez, G.		157 50 \$	1				21		
12/6/2012	Reviewed and sorder mill. Propage of back reconclidents for CPS_CPF, CPF, CPF, CPF, CPF, CPF, CPF, CPF,	24	2.4 Ryan. L.	10	\$0.00	216.00				2.4		
12/7/2012	Raview and process mail (5) Raview LP agreements, tax documents, etc. re: abandomment issues (2.0) Sign AP Checks (4)	2 8	2.9 Hebrank T	89	225 00 \$	652.50	60			2.0		
12/7/2012	Reviewed correspondence from Atty Staphens re closing. Conferred with T. Hebrank and T. Yousif re same (.4).	0.4	0 4 Rodniguez, G.	60	157.50 \$	63,00				0.4		
12/9/2012	Print out and review Quintan GP partnership agreements and tax feturns. Prepare analysis re-potential disposition.	30	3.0 Hebrank, T.	.52	225.00 \$	675.00				3.0		
12/10/2012	Review litigation response (2) Attempt to locate exhibits to Partnership Agreements (14) Review LP Agreements for net profit information, Review CP2/17 calculations (1,0). CP9 maintenance issues (5) Discuss LP discontinus with airtness (2)	3.5	3.5 Hebrank T.	8	225.00 \$	787.50				2.9		90
12/10/2012	Research limited partnership agreement for T. Hebrank. Provide draft of CP.2 sale to Co 17 calculation as prepared by Mr. Copeland.	0.8	0 8 Hoslett, S.	89	180.00 \$	144.00		0.8				
12/10/2012	Researched LP Agreements and conferred with T Hebrank re same. Corresponded with Tamens at 2ahr re CP17 property lax payments.	0.4	0.4 Ryan, L	ы	\$0.00	36.00				0.4		
12/11/2012	Review and download investor equity schedules and draff report (1.5) Respond to nreater inquirities (1.3) Review mreater BK filling and effect on NR collection Discuss with attry (.8) Review and process mail. Miss correspondence (.5)	4.1	4.1 Hebrank, T.	m (225.00 \$	922.50	8	23		ć		
12/11/2012	Corresponded with T. Habrank to fidelity fall myolds Prepared CP9 vendor payments, Recorded CP7 and CP9 vendor	0.5	D.Z. KOGriguez, G.	7	97.30	8				70		
12/11/2012	invoices. Recorded deposit for CP7, Researched and recorded Coordinat Really deposits.	1.9	1.9 Ryan L	69	\$ 00.08	171.00				1.9		

	7								80									0.5 0.5		
	0.2			0.7	Ç	0,		03	600		90		o _l	70	on O		m F		0.7	
- 2	,	9	90		12					60		90				6.3				
		90			0		0.0		0.4			80		57	80			1.6	0.8	
200	18.00	225 00		63.00	427 50	675.00	875.00	27.00	630.00	684 00	135.00	315.00		,	832.50	54 00	117.00	830.00	337.50	l
225.00	100	225 00 \$	-	00 06	225 00	225.00	112.50 \$	80'00	225.00 \$	180 00 \$	90.08	225.00		225 00 \$	225 00 \$	180.00 \$	00 06	225.00	225.00	+-
4	9 99	69	w	is	- 10	es.	00	100	w	te	ь	t/s	w	v)	69	69	н	v	es	
T Vorton	0.2 Ryan, L.	1.0 Hebrank T	DB Hoslett, S	0.7 Ryan L	19 Hebrank T	3 O Hebrank T	8.0 Hebrank, T.	0.3 Ryan, L	2.6 Hebrank, T.	3.8 Hoslett S	1,5 Ryan, L	1.4 Hebrank T	09 Ryen L	1.9 Hebrank, T.	3.7 Hebrank T	0.3 Hosielt S	13 Rven	2 8 Hebrank, T.	1.5 Hebrank T.	
Met with Atty Torres and J. Goderd re; Kohut investor, Met with Atty Barry er (2.1) Discuss investor forensis with L. Ryan Barry er (3.1) Discuss investor forensis with L. Ryan		Review N/R payments (.4) Review and process mail. Misc	Research loan payment issues for T. Kovalivker. Review Kohut Equity investment issues report prepared by Kohut CPA.	Researched and corresponded with T. Hebrenk re Fixed trooms 3 reserved from A. Base, Conferred with S. Hebrell re Kchul investor Caganet bank recordination for Exed Income 3.	Inquire as to CP18 sales proceads investment options (.3) Discuss and review status of upcoming forensic reports (.7) Discuss Kohut equity stakes and their forensic report (.5) CP2/17 terrait; issues (.4)	Prepare for and attend Court hearing (2.0) Met with Atty Quinlan and M. Steale for IP abandoment Issues. Following (1.0)	Travel toffrom LA for Court Hearing	Reviewed and recorded Copeland vendor involces CP9 insurance and lease renewal issues. (6) CP2/17 settlement	analysis and set up medting (5). Review CP10 order and related issues of Discuss with Atty Barry (5). CP8 abandorment discussion with Alty, Stary for and process mail (4).		Confirmed CPE rait to il for accuracy and thorated Confinered with S. Hoselst are Khut accommant re questions on Khut in secondard requestions on Khut in secondard CPE and CPT deposits. Reviewed and recorded fee app. Recorded CPE and CPT deposits. Recorded CPT vendor invoices. Forwarded requested Cuickbook files for T-theticark.	Follow up on notes receivable collection issues. Discuss with Ally Kovalkiver (5) Investor calls and correspondence (5) Review Court (flowalkiver (3)).	Prepared bank reconcilietion for Copeland Realty and Fixed Income 2, Recorded Copeland Realty perments. Preformed backup of all Copeland QuickBooks files.	T/C with investors (4) Assist with information and provide analysis on LP algorithments and terms (7) Misc correspondence (4) Make Decestra (4)	Invesior call (3) Mat with R. Sheele re, LP abandonments. Discuss with Alty Barry, Locate and provide poquested documents (2.D) Review LP Agenerante and resease (5) Review and sign Alty checks (5) Agenerante and resease (5) Review and sign Alty checks (5) Discussion with CPR Bander chilow unt. (4)		Corresponded with S. Hostettre interest calculations. Recorded Copeland Reality deposit. Conferred with T. Hobbrank re-recent Order Prepared Copeland Reality and CP16 World preparent Prepared bank recordisting to CP16. Prepared CP16 are installed financial information	Misc legal correspondence and updates with Atty Barry (5). Review and process mail. Make deposits (7). Download and scan orders and fillings. Have pasted to website (8). Investor correspondence (3). Provide requested information to R. Stove (5).		
12/12/2012	12/12/2012	12/13/2012	12/13/2012	12/13/2012	12/14/2012	12/17/2012	12/17/2012	12/17/2012	12/18/2012	12/18/2012	12/18/2012	12/19/2012	12/19/2012	12/20/2012	12/21/2012	12/21/2012	12/21/2012	12/26/2012	12/27/2012	

12/28/2012	CP9 abandonnent lissues and followup (.4) CP10 transition issues (.3) Receive and review CP16 purchase offers, Discuss with Alty Barry, Addn discussion of CP16 default (.9) Review and sign A/P check nan (.5)	60	S Hebrank T	69	225.00 \$		405.00	5				100 100		
12/28/2012	Conferred with T. Youalf is potential sate of CP 18 (1). Reviewed same offers and corresponded with T. Hebrank (2).	0.3	0.3 Rodriguez, G	49	157.50 8	1	47.25				-	E 0		
12/31/2012	Post filings on website (4) Updates on CP15 purchase offers (2) Review and process mail. Sign and distribute AP checks (5)	1.1	1.1 Habrank T.	103	225 00 8		247 50	0				00		
12/31/2012	Propored markgage payments for CP2, CP3, CP1, CP10 and CP16. Prepared management fee payments. Propared vandor payments for CP17 and CP10.	3.5	S Ryan L	49	8 00.06	1 1	135,00					1,5		
SubTotal Fees		79.4		+		\$ 14.5	14,985.00	20.0	40.4		20	39.2	0.5	13
		-				60	486.05				H			
						60								
Grand Total				-		\$ 15,471.06	171.05							
		57.1	Hebrank, T	45	225.00	149	12,172,50 \$	3.825.00	\$ 1,102.50	\$ 450.00	\$ 00	5.040.00	112.50 \$	1,642,50
		5.5	Hoslot, S.	co	180.00		\$ 00.086		\$ 890.00	40	5			
		ш	Rodriguez, G.	w	157,50 \$		724.50 \$					724.50 8		
		12.2	Ryan, L.	60	90.00		1,098.00 \$			50	s.	1,098.00 \$		
		10.4				\$ 14.5	385 00 8	3,825,00	\$ 14,985.00 8 3,825.00 \$ 2,092.50	100	8	450,00 \$ 6,862,50 \$	112.50 \$	1,842.50

EXHIBIT "B"

SEC - Copeland	ee Application #5 Summary - Fees
SEC	Fee /

י מני שלאוולמלי שיי		ouiiiiaiy - r cco				9	į									
										Billin	ည်	ategor	Billing Category Allocation	_		
Date Description of Services	Hours	Personnel	Per	Per Hour	유	Total Fee		∢	m.	_		U	۵	ш		ட
Oct 12	72.6	Hebrank, T.	s	225.00	S	16,335.00	69	6,817,50	\$ 2,6	2,610.00	S		\$ 3,645.00	s,	5	3,262.50
	50.8	Hoslett, S.	s,	180.00	s	9,144.00	s	45	\$ 9,1,	9,144.00	s	*	\$	vs.	\$	
	27.6	Rodriguez, G.	s	157.50	s	3,953.25	s	393.75	s	,	10	189.00	\$ 3,370.50	· ·	S	
	9.09	Ryan, L.	s	90.00	s	5,454.00	s	162.00	\$ 3,9	3,987.00	s		\$ 1,305.00	\$	\$	
	211.6				S	34,886.25	s	7,373.25	\$ 15,741.00	-	\$	189.00	\$ 8,320.50	\$	S	3,262.50
Nov 12	84.9	Hebrank, T.	\$	225.00	S	18,483.75	\$	5,321.25	\$ 2,6	2,610.00	Ş	675.00	\$ 6,322.50	\$ 630.00	\$	2,925.00
	70.7	Hoslett, S.	s	180.00	ş	12,726.00	₩.		\$ 12,726.00	\vdash	S	3	, S	٠	·s	a
	18.2	Rodriguez, G.	s)	157.50	\$	2,866.50	s.	2	٠S	•	Ş	*	\$ 2,866.50	φ.	₹	•
	28.2	Ryan, L.	S,	90.00	S	2,538.00	s,		\$ 7	702.00	₹S.	8	\$ 1,836.00	\$	₹.	39
	202.0				\$	36,614.25	\$	5,321.25	\$ 16,038.00	-	ş	675.00	\$ 11,025.00	\$ 630.00	S	2,925.00
Dec 12	57.1	Hebrank, T.	\$	225.00	S	12,172.50	s	3,825.00	\$ 1,1	1,102.50	\$	450.00	\$5,040.00	\$ 112.50	\$ 0	1,642.50
	5.5	Hoslett, S.	₩.	180.00	÷	990.00	\$	10	\$ 9	00.066	\$	ï	\$	Ş	₹.	80
	4.6	Rodriguez, G.	÷	157.50	Ş	724.50	Ş		Ş		Ş	4	\$ 724.50	\$	Ş	×
	12.2	Ryan, L.	₩	90,00	S	1,098.00	٠S	70	S	*	₹.	¥	\$ 1,098.00	\$	S	200
	79.4				Ş	14,985.00	❖	3,825.00	\$ 2,0	2,092.50	s	450.00	\$ 6,862.50	\$ 112.50	\$	1,642.50
Grand Total	214.6	Hebrank, T.	\$	225.00	s	46,991.25	٠Ş.	15,963.75	\$ 6,3	6,322.50	5 1,	1,125.00	\$ 15,007.50	\$ 742.50	\$	7,830.00
	127.0	Hosiett, S.	٠S	180.00	s	22,860.00	₹ 2}-	٠	\$ 22,8	\$ 22,860.00	Ş	3	\$	\$	Š	*
	50.4	Rodriguez, G.	s	157.50	÷	7,544.25	₹	393.75	S	22	\$	189.00	\$ 6,961.50	\$	₹S.	40
	101.0	Ryan, L.	\$	90.00	\$	9,090.00	÷	162.00	S	4,689.00	Ş	29	\$ 4,239.00	\$	Ş	
	493.0	Total			₩	86,485.50	4s	16,519.50		71.50	\$ 1,	314.00	\$33,871.50 \$ 1,314.00 \$26,208.00 \$ 742.50	\$ 742.50		\$ 7,830.00

SEC - Copeland Fee Application #5 Summary - Hours

	ce replication as				L						
							BIII	Billing Category Allocation	Allocation		
Date	Description of Services	Hours	Personnel	Per Hour	Total Fee	4	m	υ	۵	ш	ш
Oct 12		72.6	Hebrank, T.			30.3	11.6	0.0	16.2	0.0	14.5
		50.8	Hoslett, S.			0.0	50.8	0.0	0.0	0.0	0.0
		27.6	Rodriguez, G.			5.0	0.0	1.2	21.4	0.0	0.0
		9.09	Ryan, L.			1.8	44.3	0.0	14.5	0.0	0.0
		211.6				37.1	106.7	1.2	52.1	0.0	14.5
											•
Nov 12		84.9	Hebrank, T.			26.4	11.6	3.0	28.1	2.8	13.0
		70.7	Hoslett, S.			0.0	70.7	0.0	0'0	0.0	0.0
		18.2	Rodriguez, G.			0.0	0.0	0.0	18.2	0.0	0.0
		28.2	Ryan, L.			0.0	7.8	0.0	20.4	0.0	0.0
		202.0				26.4	90.1	3.0	66.7	2.8	13.0
Dec 12		57.1	Hebrank, T.			20.0	4.9	2.0	22.4	0.5	7.3
		5.5	Hoslett, S.			0.0	5.5	0.0	0.0	0.0	0.0
		4.6	Rodriguez, G.			0.0	0.0	0.0	4.6	0.0	0.0
		12.2	Ryan, L.			0.0	0.0	0.0	12.2	0.0	0.0
		79.4				20.0	10.4	2,0	39.2	9.0	7.3
Grand Total	al	214.6	Hebrank, T.			76.7	28.1	5.0	66.7	3.3	34.8
		127.0	Hoslett, S.			0.0	127.0	0.0	0.0	0.0	0.0
		50.4	Rodriguez, G.			5.0	0.0	1.2	44.2	0.0	0.0
		101.0	Ryan, L.			1.8	52.1	0.0	47.1	0.0	0.0
		493.0	Total			83.5	207.2	6.2	158.0	3.3	34.8

EXHIBIT "C"

SEC - Copeland Fee Application #5 Summary - Costs

Project	Date	Description	Expense	Personnel
501	10/31/2012	Postage - Corp Office	\$ 35.17	E3
501		Parking - Corp Office	\$ 26.00	E3
501	10/31/2012	Amtrak - Court Hearing	\$ 112.00	Hebrank
501		Website Additions	\$ 440.00	E3
501	10/31/2012	Storage	\$ 105.00	E3
501	10/31/2012	Copies 639 @ .15	\$ 95.85	Hebrank
		Subtotal	\$ 814.02	
501	11/2/2012	Amtrak - Court Hearing	\$ 112.00	Hebrank
501	11/30/2012	Website Additions	\$ 240.00	E3
501	11/30/2012	Storage	\$ 105.00	E3
501	11/30/2012	Parking	\$ 74.75	E3/Corp Office
501	11/30/2012		\$ 25.58	E3/Corp Office
501	11/30/2012	Postage		E3/Corp Office
501	11/30/2012	Copies 872 @.15	\$ 130.80	Hebrank
		Subtotal	\$ 739.40	
501	12/9/2012	Print of GP Agreements and Tax Returns 165@ .15	\$ 24.75	Hebrank
501	12/17/2012	Amtrak - Court Hearing	\$ 112.00	Hebrank
501	12/31/2012	Website Additions	\$ =	
501	12/31/2012	Pacer	\$ 61.20	Hebrank
501	12/31/2012	Parking	\$ 23.75	E3
501	12/31/2012		\$ 105.00	
501	12/31/2012		\$ 37.26	
501	12/31/2012	Copies 814 @ .15	\$ 122.10	Hebrank
		Subtotal	\$ 486.06	
		Total	\$ 2,039.48	

```
Everett G. Barry, Jr. (SBN 053119)
   John H. Stephens (SBN 82971)
   Patrick L. Prindle (SBN 87516)
   MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP
   401 West A Street, 17th Floor
  San Diego, CA 92101-7994
   Telephone: 619-238-1010
   Facsimile: 619-238-1981
6
   Attorneys for Permanent Receiver,
   Thomas C. Hebrank
 7
8
                  UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
9
10
       CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA, WESTERN DIVISION
11
12
   SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE
                                    CASE NO. 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB
   COMMISSION,
13
                                    NOTICE OF LODGMENT OF
              Plaintiff,
                                    ORDER APPROVING FIFTH
14
                                    INTERIM APPLICATION FOR
                                    APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND COSTS TO THOMAS
    ٧.
15
                                    C. HEBRANK, AS RECEIVER
   CHARLES P. COPELAND,
16
   COPELAND WEALTH
                                    DATE: March 18, 2013
17
   MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL
                                    TIME: 10:00 a.m.
   ADVISORY CORPORATION,
                                    DEPT. 8, 2nd Floor
18
   AND COPELAND WEALTH
   MANAGEMENT, A REAL
19
                                    Judge: Hon. Manuel L. Real
   ESTATE CORPORATION.
20
              Defendants.
21
22
23
        Mulvaney Barry Beatty Linn & Mayers LLP, counsel for Receiver
24
    Thomas C. Hebrank, hereby lodges Exhibit "A" – [Proposed] Order
25
    111111
26
    111111
27
    111111
28
    111111
```

NOTICE OF LODGMENT

Approving Fifth Interim Application for Approval and Payment of Fees and Costs to Thomas C. Hebrank, as Receiver.

> MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP

DATED: February 15, 2013

By: /s/ Patrick L. Prindle Everett G. Barry, Jr. John H. Stephens Patrick L. Prindle Attorneys for Permanent Receiver, Thomas C. Hebrank

HEBCO.125.353346.1

NOTICE OF LODGMENT

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA, WESTERN DIVISION

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION.

Plaintiff,

٧.

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

21

CHARLES P. COPELAND, COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL ADVISORY CORPORATION, AND COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A REAL ESTATE CORPORATION,

Defendants.

CASE NO. 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB

ORDER APPROVING FIFTH
INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR
APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF
FEES AND COSTS TO THOMAS
C. HEBRANK

Date: March 18, 2013 Time: 10:00 a.m. Dept.: 8, 2nd Floor

Judge: Honorable Manuel L. Real

20 -

At the above time and date, the Court convened for the purpose of hearing the Fifth Interim Fee Application For Approval And Payment Of Fees And Costs To Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent Receiver. Appearances were made by Everett G. Barry, Jr., Thomas C. Hebrank, Peter A. Davidson, William P. Tooke, Francis E. Quinlan, Jr., and Sam S. Puathasnanon, as noted in the Court's record.

27

28 | /////

/////

Advisory

Everett G. Barry, Jr. (SBN 053119) John H. Stephens (SBN 82971) Patrick L. Prindle (SBN 87516) MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP 401 West A Street, 17th Floor San Diego, CA 92101-7994 Telephone: 619-238-1010 Facsimile: 619-238-1981 6 Attorneys for Receiver Thomas C. Hebrank 7 8 UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 9 CENTRAL DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA, WESTERN DIVISION 10 11 SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE CASE NO. 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB COMMISSION. 12 CERTIFICATION BY APPLICANT Plaintiff. 13 March 18, 2013 14 ٧. DATE: TIME: 10:00 a.m. 15 CHARLES P. COPELAND, DEPT. 8, 2nd Floor **COPELAND WEALTH** 16 MANAGEMENT, A FINANCIAL Judge: Hon. Manuel L. Real ADVISORY CORPORATION, 17 AND COPELAND WEALTH MANAGEMENT, A REAL 18 ESTATE CORPORATION, 19 Defendants. 20 21 22 I, Thomas C. Hebrank, certify that: 23

- 1. Applicant has read the Fifth Interim Fee Application for Approval and Payment of Compensation of Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent Receiver:
- 2. To the best of the Applicant's knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the Fifth Interim Fee Application for Approval and Payment of Compensation of Thomas C. Hebrank,

1

24

25

26

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Permanent Receiver, and all fees and expenses therein are true and accurate and comply with the Billing Instructions (with any exceptions specifically noted in the Certification and described in the Application);

- All fees contained in the Application are based on the rates 3. listed in the Applicant's fee schedule attached hereto and such fees are reasonable, necessary and commensurate with the skill and experience required for the activity performed;
- 4. Applicant has not included in the amount which reimbursement is sought the amortization of the cost of any investment, equipment, or capital outlay (except to the extent that any such amortization is included within the permitted allowable amounts set forth herein for photocopies and facsimile transmission); and,
- In seeking reimbursement for a service which Applicant 5. justifiably purchased or contracted for from a third party (such as copying, imaging, bulk mail, messenger service, overnight courier, computerized research, or title and lien searches), Applicant requests reimbursement only for the amount billed to Applicant by the third party vendor and paid by Applicant to such vendor. If such services are performed by the receiver, the receiver will certify that it is not making a profit on such reimbursable service.

DATED: February 15, 2013 By: /s/ Thomas C. Hebrank Thomas C. Hebrank, Permanent Receiver

HEBCO.125.353376.1

Case	2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB Document 218-6 #:4091	Filed 02/15/13 Page 1 of 10 Page ID	
1 2 3 4 5 6 7	John H. Stephens (SBN 82971) Patrick L. Prindle (SBN 87516) MULVANEY BARRY BEATTY LINN & MAYERS LLP 401 West A Street, 17th Floor San Diego, CA 92101-7994 Telephone: 619-238-1010 Facsimile: 619-238-1981 Attorneys for Permanent Receiver, Thomas C. Hebrank		
8	UNITED STATES	DISTRICT COURT	
9			
10	SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE	CASE NO. 11-cv-08607-R-DTB	
11	COMMISSION,	CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE	
12	Plaintiff,	DATE: March 18, 2013	
13	V.	TIME: 10:00 a.m.	
14 15	CHARLES P. COPELAND, ET	Crtrm: 8, 2nd Floor Judge: Hon. Manuel L. Real	
16	AL.,		
17	Defendants.		
18			
19	I, Cindy Jennings, declare the	at I am over the age of 18 years and	
20	I · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	nployed in the County of San Diego, the subject service occurred. My	
21	California, within which county the subject service occurred. My business address is 401 West A Street, 17th Floor, San Diego,		
22	California, 92101-7994.		
23	On February 15, 2013, I serve	ed the following documents:	
24	• FIFTH INTERIM APPLIC	ATION FOR APPROVAL AND	
25		COSTS TO THOMAS C. HEBRANK,	
26	AS RECEIVER; NOTICE OF HEARING ON FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION		
27		MENT OF FEES AND COSTS TO IK, PERMANENT RECEIVER;	
28			

SAN

NOTICE OF LODGMENT OF ORDER APPROVING FIFTH INTERIM APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL AND PAYMENT OF FEES AND COSTS TO THOMAS C. HEBRANK, AS RECEIVER;
 CERTIFICATION BY APPLICANT.

 X BY MAIL. I placed each envelope for collection and mailing following ordinary business practices. I am readily familiar with Mulvaney Barry Beatty Linn & Mayers LLP's practice for collection and processing correspondence for mailing with the United States Postal Service pursuant to which practice all correspondence will be deposited.

[SEE ATTACHED SERVICE LIST]

with the United States Postal Service the same day in the ordinary

course of business by placing a true copy of the foregoing document(s) in a separate, sealed envelope with postage fully prepaid, for each

X BY ELECTRONIC NOTICE VIA THE ECF SYSTEM. I electronically filed the document(s) listed above with the Clerk of the Court by using the CM/ECF system. Participants in the case who are registered CM/ECF users will be served by the CM/ECF system. Participants in the case who are not registered EM/ECF users will be served by mail or by other means permitted by the court rules.

X FEDERAL. I hereby certify that I am employed in the office of a member of the Bar of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of California, at whose direction this service was made.

Executed on February 15, 2013, at San Diego, California.

Condy Vennings
Cindy Jennings

HEBCO.125.353386.1

addressee named hereafter.

<u>U</u>nited States District Court Central District of CA Western Division – Los Angeles Securities and Exchange Commission v. Charles P. Copeland et al.

Case No. 2:11-cv-08607-R-DTB

SERVICE/MAILING LIST

Updated: 2/4/13

Charles P. Copeland	Gregory J. Sherwin Esq.	One West Bank
Copeland Group	Fields Fehn & Sherwin	888 East Walnut St
25809 Business Center Dr., Ste B	11755 Wilshire Blvd 5th Flr	Pasadena CA 91101
Redlands CA 2374	Los Angeles CA 90025-1521	
Michael T. O'Callaghan Esq.	Flagstar Bank	Dana Leigh Ozols Esq.
Mark J. Furuya Esq.	Mail-Stop W-205-2	The Wolf Firm A Law Corporation
Sabaitis O'Callaghan LLP		Attorneys to the Financial Services
	5151 Corporate Dr.	
975 E. Green St	Troy MI 48098	Industry
Pasadena CA 1106		2955 Main St 2 nd Flr
		Irvine CA 92614
Wells Fargo Commercial Mortgage	LNR (loan servicer)	C-III Asset Management LLC
Attn: Ken Murray	Attn: Jorge Rodriguez	Attn: Kathy Patterson
1901 Harrison St 7th Flr	1601 Washington Ave 7th Flr	5221 N. O'Connor Blvd Ste. 600
Oakland CA 94612	Miami FL 33139	Irving TX 75039
Home Savings & Loan	Wells Fargo Commercial	Andrew J. Haley, Esq.
Attn: Dan NY White	Mortgage Servicing	Greenwald Pauly Foster & Miller P.C.
275 W. Federal St	1901 Harrison St 7 th FIr	1299 Ocean Ave Ste 400
Youngstown OH 44503	Oakland CA 94612	Santa Monica CA 0401-1007
Pamela Wachter McAfee	Anh T. Nong & Nhon Nguyen	Barbara Whan
Nelson Mullins Riley & Scarborough LLP	TTEE Pen	33861 Plumtree Ln
GlenLake One Ste 200	209 E. Sunset Dr South	Yucaipa CA 92399
4140 Parklake Ave	Redlands CA 92373	1 4 5 4 1 5 7 1 5 2 5 5 5
Raleigh NC 27612	Trodialius OA 32010	
Adele M. Hansen	Pohort & Cladya Mitaball	Potty Markwordt
	Robert & Gladys Mitchell	Betty Markwardt
6609 Summertrail Place	11761 Almond Court	1220 West 4th St
Highland CA 92346	Loma Linda CA 92354	Anaconda MT 59711
Barbara Z. Stahr	Carol P. Lowe	Charles Grey
667 Gull Dr.	1837 Onda Dr.	63 Turnbury Ln.
Bodega Bay CA 94923	Camarillo CA 93010	Irvine CA 92620
Carol Docis	Richard Neal	Charles Schwab
Brokerage A/C	7322 Starboard St.	FBO Robert Howard IRA
18028 W. Kenwood Ave.	Carlsbad CA 92011	502 Avenida La Costa
Devore CA 92407		San Clemente CA 92672
Charles Schwab	Bonnie Kilmer	William F Davis
FBO Melvyn B. Roth IRA	5120 Breckenridge Ave	Re: Floyd N. Andersen
5401 Lido Sands Dr	Banning CA 92220	Highway 111 #9-472
Newport Beach CA 92663-2204	Ĭ	La Quinta CA 92253
Charles Schwab	Maria Perez	Geoffrey A. Gardiner
FBO Irena Sniecinski IRA	1364 Aurora Ln	11535 Acacia St
P.O. Box 161680	San Bernardino CA 92408	Loma Linda CA 92354
Big Sky MT 59716-1680	San Bernardino O/C 92400	Lonia Linda O/1 02007
Fred & Joyce Dimmitt	Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab
321 Myrtlewood Dr	FBO Melvyn Ross Roth IRA	FBO Janet Ihde IRA
Calimesa CA 92320	5401 Lido Sands Dr	35-800 Bob Hope Dr Ste 225
Ob arte a O above b	Newport Beach CA 92663	Rancho Mirage CA 92270
Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab
FBO Janet K. Ihde IRA	FBO Kirk Howard Roth IRA	FBO Leonard F. Neumann IRA
P.O. Box 2131	1648 Woodlands Rd	30176 Live Oak Canyon Rd
Palm Springs CA 92263	Beaumont CA 92223	Redlands CA 92373
Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab
FBO Albert IRA	FBO Angela Ellingson IRA	FBO Harold Racine IRA
232 Anita Court	1155 Dysart Dr	1408 S. Center St
Redlands CA 92373	Banning CA 92220	Redlands CA 92373

Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab
FBO Donald I. Peterson IRA Rollover	FBO Janet Ihde IRA	FBO Kirk Howard IRA
24418 Lawton Ave	P.O. Box 2131	1648 Woodlands Rd
Loma Linda CA 92354	Palm Springs CA 92263	Beaumont CA 92223
Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab	Charles Schwab
FBO Janet Ihde	FBO Melvyn Ross Roth IRA	FBO Richard Paul Blandford Roth IRA
74-785 Hwy 111	5401 Lido Sands Dr	7838 Valmont St
Wall St W Bldg #102	Newport Beach CA 92663	Highland CA 92346
Indian Wells CA 92210		
Charles Schwab	Jacobson Trust	Christi C. Higdon
FBO Karl Phillips Roth IRA	384 Mesa Verde Park	11331 Sundance Lane
27878 Via Sarasate	Beaumont CA 92223	Boca Raton, FL 33428
Mission Viejo CA 92692		
Robert & Enid McColloch	J. Jay & Theresa Whan	Clem M. McColloch Trust
5520 Apple Orchard Ln	30660 Susan Dr	5520 Apple Orchard Ln
Riverside CA 92506	Cathedral City CA 92234	Riverside CA 92506
Christine Coffman	Cinque Family Trust	David Ziilch Trust
11331 Sundance Lane	36261 Chaparral Court	941 Kensington Dr
Boca Raton, FL 33428	Yucaipa CA 92399	Redlands CA 92374
Cynthia Healy	David Conston	Dusty Bricker
2560 Gorden Rd. Ste 201-A	417 Chino Canyon	28 Ave At Port Imperial #220
Monterey CA 93942	Palm Springs CA 92262	West New York, NJ 07093
Diana M. Weed	Dotan Family Trust	Elena Nizzia
1339 Wallach Place NW	1618 Woodlands	1155 Dysart Dr
Washington DC 20009	Beaumont CA 92228	Banning CA 92220
Earl R. Schamehorn Jr.	Eddie & Jamie Dotan	Gordon & Myra Peterson
		118 Edgemont Dr
1721 Valley Falls Ave	20 Fairlee Terrace	
Redlands CA 92374	Waban MA 02468	Redlands CA 92373
Fred & Elaine Hollaus	James Powell	James R. Watson MD Inc.
1096 Deer Clover Way	12535 Redstone Circle	Profit Sharing Plan
Castle Pines, CO 80108-8271	Yucaipa CA 92399	259 Terracina Blvd
		Redlands CA 92373
Henry W. Shelton	Jessie Coleen Birch Revocable Trust	Jill A. Meader Revocable Trust
805 Nottingham Dr	1948 Cave St	27250 Nicolas Rd Apt. A231
Redlands CA 92373	Redlands CA 92374	Temecula CA 92591
Hu Tongs Inc.	JRT Revocable Trust	Kasota Group
16127 Kasota Rd Ste 105	Jon Taylor Trustee	279 Green Mountain
Apple Valley CA 92307	P.O. Box 681	Palm Desert CA 92211
	Calimesa CA 92320	
James P. Gerrard	Kathleen R. Wright	Katie Hernandez
1562 Lisa Ln	3605 Bonita Verde Dr	P.O. Box 8874
Redlands CA 92374	Bonita CA 91902	Redlands CA 92375
Jean Seyda	Robert Casady	Jon J. Whan
168 Lakeshore Dr	14047 Pamlico Rd	30660 Susan Dr
Rancho Mirage CA 92270	Apple Valley CA 92307	Cathedral City CA 92234
Joe Pinkner	Leonard F. Neumann	Leslie G. Laybourne
279 Green Mountain	30176 Live Oak Canyon Rd	11050 Bryant St Space 276
Palm Desert CA 92211	Redlands CA 92373	Yucaipa CA 92399
Joseph Dotan	Louise Coffman	Luckey Charitable Trust
1618 Woodlands	19291 Sabal Lake Dr	8531 Glendale Rd
Beaumont CA 92228	Boca Raton FL 33434	Hesperia CA 92345
Kathi Seegraves	Margarita Estrada Perez	Marjorie Hatfield Living Trust
20521 Whitstone Circle	•	(Peggy Neumann)
Bend OR 97702	P.O. Box 370	30176 Live Oak Canyon Rd
55.10 517 517 52	Chino CA 91708	Redlands CA 92373
Khari Baker	Mary Margaret Hasy Revocable Trust	Melvyn & Ruth Ross
27878 Via Sarasate	6609 Summer Trail Place	5401 Lido Sands Dr.
Mission Viejo CA 92692	Highland CA 92346	Newport Beach CA 92663
Smith Revocable Trust	Neal & Ruth Bricker Family Trust	Neal Living Trust
Lenna Smith 38367 Cherrywood Dr	985 S Orange Grove Blvd Unit 101	7322 Starboard St
	Pasadena CA 91105	Carlsbad CA 92011
	11000dono (*A ()440E	

Lillian N. Franklin	Ngyuen & Nong Pension Plan	Patrice A. Milkovich
740 E. Avery St	209 East Sunset Dr South	3605 Bonita Verde Dr
San Bernardino CA 92404	Redlands CA 92373	Bonita CA 91902
Manley J. Luckey	Peggy Hatfield Neumann	Perez Family Survivors Trust
8531 Glendale Rd	30176 Live Oak Canyon Rd	13219 Pipeline Ave
Hesperia CA 92345	Redlands CA 92373	Chino CA 91710
Mark & Barbara Carpenter	Peterson Revocable Living Trust	Pinkner Family Trust
35571 Sleepy Hollow Rd	24418 Lawton Ave	279 Green Mountain
Yucaipa CA 92399	Loma Linda CA 92354	Palm Desert CA 92211
Neonatology Medical Group Inc.	Ron Mitchell	Samuel D. Gregory
Retirement Plan	12033 Fourth St	4432 Strong St
731 Buckingham Dr	Yucaipa CA 92399	Riverside CA 92501
Redlands CA 92374	Tucaipa OA 32333	Niverside OA 32001
Paul Family Trust	Schachtel Family Trust	Steele Family Trust
P.O. Box 7357	6 Strauss Terrace	26858 Calle Real
Redlands CA 92375	Rancho Mirage CA 92270	Capistrano Beach CA 92624
Perry Damiani	Taber Family Trust	TD Ameritrade
16127 Kasota Rd Ste 105	1475 Crestview Rd	FBO Steven IRA
Apple Valley CA 92307	Redlands CA 92374	14424 Greenpoint Ln
		Huntersville NC 28078
Rhonda Dean	Donna Wooley	TD Ameritrade
1705 Antho NY Ave	12721 Columbia Ave	FBO Betty Markwardt IRA
Cottage Grove OR 97424	Yucaipa CA 92399	1220 West 4th St
<u> </u>		Anaconda MT 59711
Robert R. & Elayne Allen	TD Ameritrade	Cynthia Gillilan
Route 2 Box 284	FBO Horace Dillow IRA	39292 Oak Glen Rd
Ellington MO 63638	1343 Crestview Rd	Yucaipa CA 92399
g	Redlands CA 92374	
Sandra And Perry Hayes	Jennifer Smith	TD Ameritrade
111 E. Sunset Dr South	38367 Cherrywood Dr	FBO Eddie Dotan Rollover IRA
Redlands CA 92373	Murrieta CA 92562	20 Fairlee Terrace
Rediatios CA 92373	Mumeta CA 92502	
Otaba Living Tayet	TD Amaritmada	Waban MA 02468
Stahr Living Trust	TD Ameritrade	The Bork Family Trust
667 Gull Dr	FBO Joseph Dotan IRA	24968 Lawton Ave
Bodega Bay CA 94923	1618 Woodlands Rd	Loma Linda CA 92357
	Beaumont CA 92223	
TD Ameritrade	Ziilch Family Trust	Thomas Phillips
FBO Charles Grey IRA	667 Gull Dr	1582 Huckleberry Ln
63 Turnbury Ln	Bodega Bay CA 94923	San Luis Obispo CA 93401
Irvine CA 92620		
TD Ameritrade FBO Jill Meader IRA	William & Marion Conley	Ziilch Bypass Trust
27250 Nicolas Rd Apt. A231	376 Franklin Ave	667 Gull Dr
Temecula CA 92591	Redlands CA 92373	Bodega Bay CA 94923
TD Ameritrade	Louis G. Fournier III	Debra B. Gervais
FBO Stephen Weiss IRA Rollover	The Sutton Companies	Law Office of Debra B. Gervais
109 Midland Rd.	525 Plum St., Ste 100	302 West South Ave
Charlestown RI 02813	Syracuse NY 13204	Redlands CA 92373
TD Ameritrade	Michael S. Leib	Rollie A. Peterson Esq.
FBO Ehud Dotan IRA	Maddin Hauser Wartell Roth & Heller PC	
		Peterson & Kell
20 Fairlee Terrace	Third FIr Essex Centre	2377 Gold Meadow Way Ste 280
Waban WA 02468	28400 Northwestern Highway	Gold River, CA 95670
TD A '' I	Southfield MI 48034-8004	B # 300 L
TD Ameritrade	Gregory Glenn	Dorothy Ziilch
FBO Dallas Stahr IRA	Glenn Conservatorship	667 Gull Dr
667 Gull Dr	Cynthia Healy	Bodega Bay, CA 94923
Bodega Bay CA 94923	P. O. Box 4037	
	Monterey CA 93942	
The Peterson Revocable Living Trust	Judy Racine	William & Dolores McDonald
24418 Lawton Ave	1408 S. Center St	1354 Rhonda Ln
Loma Linda, CA 92354	Redlands CA 92373	Redlands, CA 92373
Timothy C. Weed	Norman & Lois Smith	Brian & Sheri Branson
133 E. Palm Ln	36135 Golden Gate Dr.	302 W. South Ave
Redlands, CA 92373	Yucaipa CA 92399	Redlands, CA 92373

David Holden	Chris Condon	Mark Edwards
555 W. Redlands Blvd	1334 Susan Ave	P.O. Box 9058
Redlands, CA 92373	Redlands, CA 92374	Redlands, CA 92346
William R. & Janice L. Steele	Frank Quinlan	Joy Atiga
26858 Calle Real	895 Dove St 5 th Flr	12925 Hilary Way
Capistrano Beach, CA 92624 Harold Raune	Newport Beach, CA 92660 Karl Schamehorn	Redlands, CA 92373 John Coombe
Richard D. McCune Jr.	1005 Hamlin Place	5 First American Way 4 th FIr
McCune Wright LLP	Redlands, CA 92373	Santa Ana, CA 92707
2068 Orange Tree Ln., Ste 216	rediands, OA 32373	Jania Ana, OA 32101
Redlands, CA 92374		
Phillip Wang	David Baldridge	Judy Baca
Duane Morris LLP	1717 Chaparrall #2	1001 West Balboa Blvd
One Market Plaza Spear Tower, Ste 2200	Redlands, CA 92373	Newport Beach, CA 92661
San Francisco CA 94105-1127		
Suzane L. Bricker	Dusty Bricker	Klaus K.A. Kuehn
1444 W. 11th St	241 W. 97 th St #14M	3404 Beverly Dr
Upland CA 91786	New York NY 10025	San Bernardino CA 92405
Wright Family Living Trust	Stewart R. Wright	Higdon Revocable Trust
111 Sierra Vista Dr	111 Sierra Vista Dr	29107 Guava Ln
Redlands CA 92373	Redlands CA 92373	Big Pine Key FL 33043
Weed Family Living Trust	Susan Wright	Vellore G. Muraligopal, Muraligopal
c/o Cathy or Stephen Weed	111 Sierra Vista Dr	Living Trust
62 Rue Jean Baptiste Pigalle Paris FC 75010	Redlands CA 92373	c/o Alfonso L. Poiré, Gaw Van Male 1261 Travis Blvd., Ste 350
Palis FC 75010		Fairfield CA 94533-4825
TD Amoritrado	Pick Higdon	
TD Ameritrade FBO Don L. Higdon IRA	Rick Higdon 29107 Guava Ln	Klaus & Linda Kuehn 13138 Oak Crest Dr
1600 Rhododendron #412	Big Pine Key FL 33043	Yucaipa CA 92399
Florence OR 97439	Dig i life itey i E 00040	1 404 pt 0/1 02000
Dr John Kohut /Mrs. Joann Kohut /	Wayland W. Eure Jr. MD /	Lynch Bypass Trust
Kohut Family Trust / John J. Kohut /	FBO W.W. Eure Jr. MD Inc. IRA	Lynch Lifetime Trust
FBO John Kohut IRA	c/o David G. Moore Esq.	c/o David R. Moore
c/o Lisa Torres Esq.	Reid & Hellyer APC	Moore & Skiljan
Gates O'Doherty Gonter & Guy LLP	3880 Lemon St Fifth Flr	7700 El Camino Real Ste 207
15373 Innovation Dr Ste 170	P.O. Box 1300	Carlsbad CA 92009
San Diego CA 92128	Riverside CA 92502-1300	
George L. Fletcher/Janet G. Fletcher	George L. Fletcher	George L. Fletcher/Janet G. Fletcher
c/o Christopher A. Shumate	Janet G. Fletcher	Trustees of the Fletcher Trust dated
Albrektson Law Offices	1910 Country Club Ln	February 26 2010
1801 Orange Tree Ln Ste 230	Redlands CA 92373	1910 Country Club Ln
Redlands CA 92374-4587	MAN E I ME	Redlands CA 92373
Charles Schwab	W.W. Eure Jr. MD Inc.	Muraligopal Living Trust
FBO W.W. Eure Jr. MD Inc. IRA P.O. Box 10065	Donald Mason Registered Agent 8275 Deadwood Ct	731 Buckingham Dr Redlands CA 92374
San Bernardino CA 92423	Redlands CA 92373	Neulanus CA 92374
Vellore G. Muraligopal	John J. Kohut	Kohut Family Trust
731 Buckingham Dr	6946 Orozco Dr	6946 Orozco Dr
Redlands CA 92374	Riverside CA 92506	Riverside CA 92506
TD Ameritrade	Robert M. Shaughnessy Esq.	Dan Baker
FBO John Kohut IRA	DUCKOR SPRADLING	c/o Jonathan L. Geballe Esq.
6946 Orozco Dr	3043 4th Ave	11 Broadway Ste 615
Riverside CA 92506	San Diego CA 92103	New York NY 10004
Glenn Goodwin Trust	Benton-Cole Properties Inc.	Robert H. Ziprick Esq.
PO Box 735	11761 Almond Court	Ziprick & Cramer LLP
Skyforest CA 92385	Loma Linda CA 92354	707 Brookside Ave
,		Redlands CA 92373
Don Dones - Dhillis Dones - and M. Joseph	Pilzin Sumborg Poons Price Avalred LLD	Dill & Showler
Ben Perez, Philip Perez and Michael Perez	Bilzin Sumberg Baena Price Axelrod LLP 1450 Brickell Avenue, Suite 2300	400 Brookside Avenue
13245 Victoria Street	Miami, FL 33131-3456	Redlands, CA 92373
Rancho Cucamonga, CA 91739	111101111, I L 00101 0100	1.00.0100, 071 02010

Federal Express P.O. Box 7221 Pasadena, CA 91109-7321	Franchise Tax Board P.O. Box 942857 Sacramento, CA 94257-0601	Goodwin & Associates 1175 Idaho St., Suite 201 Redlands, CA 92374
LandAmerica Assessment Corporation P.O. Box 27567 Richmond, VA 923261	Midland Loan Services PNC Bank Lockbox Lockbox Number 771223 1223 Solutions Center Chicago, IL 60677-1002	North Carolina Department of Revenue P.O. Box 25000 Raleigh, NC 27640-0645
Paracorp dba Parasec P.O. Box 160568 Sacramento, CA 95816-0568	Premium Assignment Corporation P.O. Box 3100 Tallahassee, FL 32315-3100	Scott Showler, Attorney at Law 1839 Commercenter West San Bernardino, CA 92408
Spilman Thomas & Battle, PLLC 110 Oakwood Drive, Suite 500 Winston-Salem, NC 27103	The Goodwin Insurance Agency P.O. Box 1897 Redlands, CA 92373	United States Treasury 290 North D Street San Bernardino, CA 92401-9964
Waterstone Asset Management 8720 Red Oak Blvd., Suite 300 Charlotte, NC 28217	Higgs Benjamin 101 West Friendly Ave., Suite 500 Greensboro, NC 27401	
Alfonso L. Poiré, Esq. Gaw, Van Male, APC 1261 Travis Blvd., Suite 350 Fairfield, CA 94533	James R. Forbes, Esq. Gaw, Van Male, APC 1261 Travis Blvd., Suite 350 Fairfield, CA 94533	American West Properties, Inc. P.O. Box 1299 Lake Forest, CA 92609
Brunick, McElhaney & Beckett P.O. Box 6425 San Bernardino, CA 92412	JG Service Company 15632 El Prado Road Chino, CA 91710	MNJ Key Corp. c/o Ameirca West P.O. Box 513210 Los Angeles, CA 90051-1210
MNJ Key Corporation P.O. Box 3655 San Diego CA 92163-3655	Charles & Mildred Grey 63 Turnbury Lane Irvine, CA 92620-0244	Mound Investments Attn: Rhonda Welday 34124 Freedom Road Farmington, MI 48335
OneWest Bank 390 West Valley Parkway Escondido, CA 92025-2635	SimplexGrinnell Dept CH 10320 Palatine, IL 60055-0320	Watertight Plumbing, Inc. 16462 Gothard St., Suite 202 Huntington Beach, CA 92647
Wesseling & Brackermann 6439 28 th Avenue Hudsonville, MI 49426	Ace Restoration & Waterproofing Inc. 620 E. Walnut Avenue Fullerton, CA 92831	Champion Roof Company 2233 Martin St. Suite 202 Irvine, CA 92612
Club Resource Group 25520 Schulte Court Tracy, CA 95377	Elizabeth Branson P.O. Box 911 Loma Linda, CA 92354	Michigan Department of Treasury P.O. Box 30113 Lansing, MI 48909
Michigan Dept of Treasury P.O. Box 30774 Lansing, MI 48909-8274	State of Michigan c/o Michigan Dept. of Treasury Dept. 77003 Detroit, MI 48277-0003	Cornerstone Lane Surveying Company 958 Temescal Circle Corona, CA 92879
Don Kent Riverside County Treasurer P.O. Box 12010 Riverside, CA 92502-2210	Elrod Fence Company 6459 Mission Blvd. Riverside, CA 92509	EMC Insurance Companies P.O. Box 219225 Kansas City, MO 64121-9225
FATCO National Commercial Services Attn: Accounts Receivable Dept. 5 First American Way Santa Ana, CA 92707	Innovative Electric & Consulting Inc. 18355 Hibiscus Avenue Riverside, CA 92508	Keystone Mortgage Corporation Attn: Loan Servicing Dept. 360 N. Sepulveda Blvd., Suite El Segundo, CA 90245

Mirage Developers, Inc.	REP – Real Estate Partners	Riverside Public Utilities
121 S. Palm Canyon Dr., #208	2569 McCabe Way, 2 nd Floor	3900 Main Street
Palm Springs, CA 92262	Irvine, CA 92614	Riverside, CA 92522-0144
The Mattacola Law Firm	A J Horne Electric Company	AJ Horne Electric Company
217 N. Washington Street	c/o Goldberg & Bloom, Inc.	1200 South Broadway, Suite 105
P.O. Box 725	Attn: Robin Bloom	Lexington, KY 40504
Rome, NY 13442-0725	4750 N. Hiatus Rd.	Lexington, RT 40004
Nome, 141 10442 0720	Fort Lauderdale, FL 33351	
	Torreadderdale, TE 33331	
ADT Security Services Inc.	Aetna Building Maintenance	Allied Waste Services #922
P.O. Box 371967	P.O. Box 636290	Sacramento
Pittsburgh, PA 15250-7967	Cincinnati, OH 45263-6290	P.O. Box 78030
		Phoenix, AZ 85062-8030
Isaac Commercial Properties	B.B.D. Cleaning Service & Solutions	Ben-Tel Service
771 Corporate Drive, Suite 30	P.O. Box 817	P.O. Box 55066
Lexington, KY 40555-5066	Lawrenceburg, KY 40342	Lexington, KY 40555-5066
Lexington, ICI 10000 0000	Lawrencesday, RT 10012	Lexington, IXI 10000 0000
C & R Asphalt	Cathy Burgess Interiors	Columbia Gas of Kentucky
P.O. Box 8201	155 East Main Street, Suite 102	P.O. Box 742523
Lexington, KY 40533-8201	Lexington, KY 40507	Cincinnati, OH 45274-2523
Commonwealth of Kentucky	Davis H. Elliot Construction Co., Inc.	Derek Roscoe
Office of Housing, Building & Const.	P.O. Box 37251	c/o NAI Isaac Commercial Prop.
101 Sea Hero Road, Suite 200	Baltimore, MD 21297-3251	771 Corporate Dr., Suite 300
Frankfort, KY 40601-5405	Baltimore, IVID 21231-3231	Lexington, KY 40503
1 fallkloft, KT 40001-0400		Lexington, ICT 40000
Division of Revenue	Golden Eagle Insurance	Home Savings & Loan Company
Lexington-Fayette Urban Cnty Govt	P.O. Box 84834	Commercial Loan Dpt.
P.O. Box 14058	San Diego, CA 92186-5834	P.O. Box 1111
Lexington, KY 40512		Youngstown, OH 44501
Ohio Department of Taxation	Ohio Treasurer of State	Spillman Thomaos & Battle
P.O. Box 182101	P.O. Box 181140	300 Kanawha Blvd. East
Columbus, OH 43218-2101	Columbus, OH 43218-1140	P.O. Box 273
0014111040, 011 10210 2101	0010111000, 011 10210 1110	Charleston, WV 25321-00273
Thomas N. Jacobson, Esq.	CLMG Corp.	Locke & Lord
3750 Santa Fe Avenue, Suite 105	P.O. Box 55278	111 South Wacker Drive
Riverside, CA 92507	Boston, MA 02205-5278	Chicago, IL 60606
Alfonso L. Poiré, Esq.	James R. Forbes, Esq.	American West Properties, Inc.
Gaw, Van Male, APC	Gaw, Van Male, APC	P.O. Box 1299
1261 Travis Blvd., Suite 350	1261 Travis Blvd., Suite 350	Lake Forest, CA 92609
Fairfield, CA 94533	Fairfield, CA 94533	
i annola, on 57000	Talificia, On 94000	
Brunick, McElhaney & Beckett	JG Service Company	MNJ Key Corp.
P.O. Box 6425	15632 El Prado Road	c/o America West
San Bernardino, CA 92412		P.O. Box 513210
Jan Demarumo, CA 92412	Chino, CA 91710	
		Los Angeles, CA 90051-1210
MNJ Key Corporation	Charles & Mildred Grey	Mound Investments
P.O. Box 3655	63 Turnbury Lane	Attn: Rhonda Welday
San Diego CA 92163-3655	Irvine, CA 92620-0244	34124 Freedom Road
		Farmington, MI 48335

OneWest Bank 390 West Valley Parkway	SimplexGrinnell Dept CH 10320	Watertight Plumbing, Inc. 16462 Gothard St., Suite 202
Escondido, CA 92025-2635	Palatine, IL 60055-0320	Huntington Beach, CA 92647
Wesseling & Brackermann 6439 28 th Avenue	Ace Restoration & Waterproofing Inc.	Champion Roof Company
Hudsonville, MI 49426	620 E. Walnut Avenue Fullerton, CA 92831	2233 Martin St. Suite 202 Irvine, CA 92612
Club Resource Group	Elizabeth Branson	Michigan Department of Treasury
25520 Schulte Court Tracy, CA 95377	P.O. Box 911 Loma Linda, CA 92354	P.O. Box 30113 Lansing, MI 48909
Michigan Dept of Treasury P.O. Box 30774 Lansing, MI 48909-8274	State of Michigan c/o Michigan Dept. of Treasury Dept. 77003 Detroit, MI 48277-0003	Cornerstone Lane Surveying Company 958 Temescal Circle Corona, CA 92879
Don Kent Riverside County Treasurer P.O. Box 12010 Riverside, CA 92502-2210	Elrod Fence Company 6459 Mission Blvd. Riverside, CA 92509	EMC Insurance Companies P.O. Box 219225 Kansas City, MO 64121-9225
FATCO National Commercial Services Attn: Accounts Receivable Dept. 5 First American Way Santa Ana, CA 92707	Innovative Electric & Consulting Inc. 18355 Hibiscus Avenue Riverside, CA 92508	Keystone Mortgage Corporation Attn: Loan Servicing Dept. 360 N. Sepulveda Blvd., Suite El Segundo, CA 90245
Mirage Developers, Inc. 121 S. Palm Canyon Dr., #208 Palm Springs, CA 92262	REP – Real Estate Partners 2569 McCabe Way, 2 nd Floor Irvine, CA 92614	Riverside Public Utilities 3900 Main Street Riverside, CA 92522-0144
The Mattacola Law Firm 217 N. Washington Street P.O. Box 725 Rome, NY 13442-0725	A J Horne Electric Company c/o Goldberg & Bloom, Inc. Attn: Robin Bloom 4750 N. Hiatus Rd. Fort Lauderdale, FL 33351	AJ Horne Electric Company 1200 South Broadway, Suite 105 Lexington, KY 40504
ADT Security Services Inc. P.O. Box 371967 Pittsburgh, PA 15250-7967	Aetna Building Maintenance P.O. Box 636290 Cincinnati, OH 45263-6290	Allied Waste Services #922 Sacramento P.O. Box 78030 Phoenix, AZ 85062-8030
Isaac Commercial Properties 771 Corporate Drive, Suite 30 Lexington, KY 40555-5066	B.B.D. Cleaning Service & Solutions P.O. Box 817 Lawrenceburg, KY 40342	Ben-Tel Service P.O. Box 55066 Lexington, KY 40555-5066

C & R Asphalt P.O. Box 8201 Lexington, KY 40533-8201	Cathy Burgess Interiors 155 East Main Street, Suite 102 Lexington, KY 40507	Columbia Gas of Kentucky P.O. Box 742523 Cincinnati, OH 45274-2523
Commonwealth of Kentucky Office of Housing, Building & Const. 101 Sea Hero Road, Suite 200 Frankfort, KY 40601-5405	Davis H. Elliot Construction Co., Inc. P.O. Box 37251 Baltimore, MD 21297-3251	Derek Roscoe c/o NAI Isaac Commercial Prop. 771 Corporate Dr., Suite 300 Lexington, KY 40503
Division of Revenue Lexington-Fayette Urban Cnty Govt P.O. Box 14058 Lexington, KY 40512	Golden Eagle Insurance P.O. Box 84834 San Diego, CA 92186-5834	Home Savings 7 Loan Company Commercial Loan Dpt. P.O. Box 1111 Youngstown, OH 44501
Ohio Department of Taxation P.O. Box 182101 Columbus, OH 43218-2101	Ohio Treasurer of State P.O. Box 181140 Columbus, OH 43218-1140	Spillman Thomaos & Battle 300 Kanawha Blvd. East P.O. Box 273 Charleston, WV 25321-00273
Thomas N. Jacobson, Esq. 3750 Santa Fe Avenue, Suite 105 Riverside, CA 92507	CLMG Corp. P.O. Box 55278 Boston, MA 02205-5278	Locke & Lord 111 South Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606